ORDINANCE 1274

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF TRACY ADOPTING THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE,
2019 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA EXISTING
BUILDING CODE, AND 2019 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA
FIRE CODE, ADOPTING APPENDICES C, F, H, I, KAND O OF THE 2019
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, APPENDICES A, B, C, D, E, G, H, I, J AND K OF
THE 2019 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, APPENDICES D AND F OF THE 2019
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, APPENDICES H, I, O, R, S, W AND X OF THE
2019 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, ALL APPENDICES OF THE 2019
CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, APPENDICES B, BB, C, CC, D, F,
H, L AND N OF THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, ADOPTING STANDARDS
RELATED TO EMERGENCY HOUSING, STRAW-CLAY CONSTRUCTION,
CORROSIVE SOILS, EXTERIOR PALLET STORAGE, RADIO AMPLIFICATION
SYSTEMS, OTHER EMERGENCY RESPONSE STANDARDS, FLOODPLAIN
REGULATIONS AND REPEALING SECTIONS TO REORGANIZE EXISTING
ORDINANCE LANGUAGE, CORRECT CODE REFERENCES, AND CLARIFY
LANGUAGE

The City Council of the City of Tracy does hereby ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.04.010,
9.04.020 and 9.04.040 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 2: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.04.030 and
9.04.050 are hereby amended to read asfollows:

9.04.030 Adoption by reference of the California Building Code.
The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Building
Code," Volumes 1 and 2, including appendices C, F, H, I, K and O, copyrighted by
the International Code Council and the California Building Standards Commission
(hereinafter "California Building Code"), as amended by this chapter. The California
Building Code is on file with the City Clerk, and is available for inspection and
copying in accordance with Government Code section 50022.6.

9.04.050 Amendments to the California Building Code
The City of Tracy hereby makes the following local amendments to the California
Building Code:

CHAPTER 1

Section 105.2 item 1 is amended to read as follows:
1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,



Ordinance 1274
Page 2

playhouses and similar uses, provided that the floor area is not greater than 120
square feet (11m?2) and the story height does not exceed 11’ 7” feet.

Section 105.2 item 2 is amended to read as follows:
2. Fences meeting all the following
1. Not exceeding 7 feet
2. Not used as a pool, spa or hot tub barrier
3. When constructed of concrete or masonry shall not exceed 4 feet in
height above adjacent finished grade level

Section 105.3.2 is amended to read as follows:
Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for any
proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of
filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been
issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of
time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of
the building official, an application shall not be extended more than two times if this
code or any other pertinent code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to
the date of application. A new application shall be submitted and corresponding fees
shall be paid when an application has expired.

Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows:
Section 105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work
on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The
building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for
periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of the building official,
a permit shall not be extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent
code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A
new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall be paid when a permit has
expired.

CHAPTER 5

Section 501.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 501.2 Address Identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided
and maintained with approved address identification. The identification shall comply
with all of the following:

1. Not less than 4" high with a 1/2" stroke width

2. Located minimum of 6' above grade

3. llluminated at night. Illumination shall be either internal or external at an

intensity of 5.0 foot- candles

4. Numbers shall contrast with the background.

5. Numbers shall be placed on a portion of the building that is both legible and

visible from the street that fronts the property



Ordinance 1274
Page 3

6. Numbers shall not be placed on a moveable door and shall not be
obstructed from view from the street.

7. Addresses shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters and conventional
in form

Additionally, where access is by means of a private road and/or the building address
cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other approved sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Where required by the fire code official,
address numbers/figures shall be provided in additional approved locations to
facilitate emergency response.

Multiple tenant spaces serviced by vehicular access to the rear of the building
through any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall have numbers or addresses
placed prior to occupancy on all new and existing buildings as to be plainly visible
and legible from the rear access way.

Multiple tenant spaces serviced by rear access through a corridor, exit court, or exit
yard shall have approved numbers or addresses displayed on the rear of the tenant
space. Multiple tenant spaces that front on interior walkways or pedestrian malls shall
have approved numbers or addresses placed over the entrance door in all new and
existing buildings.

An illuminated annunciator or directory board shall be required at every entrance where
deemed necessary by the fire code official.

CHAPTER 18

Section 1808.6.1 is amended by adding the following text to the end of the
section:

3. Slabs-on-grade installed in conjunction with foundations shall also be designed
to resist differential volume changes and to prevent horizontal and vertical
displacement of theslab.

APPENDIX O

Section 0108.2.4 is amended to read as follows:
0108.2.4 Loft Guards. Loft guards shall be located along the open side of lofts. Loft
guards shall not be less than 42 inches (914 mm) in height. Loft guards shall not
have openings from the walking surface to the required guard height that allow
passage of a sphere 4 inches (102 mm) in diameter.

SECTION 3: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections
9.06.010, 9.06.020 and 9.06.050 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 4: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.06.030,



Ordinance 1274
Page 4

9.06.040and 9.06.060 are hereby amended to read as follows:

9.06.030 Adoption by reference of the California Fire Code.
The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Fire Code"
including appendices B,BB, C, CC, D, F, H, L and N, copyrighted by the International
Code Council and the California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter
"California Fire Code"), as amended by this chapter. The California Fire Code is on file
with the City Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance with
Government Code section 50022.6.

9.06.040 Penalty Provisions

The California Fire Code subsection 110.4 is amended to read as follows:

110.4 Violations Penalties. Violations of this Chapter shall be enforced by the
City of Tracy in accordance with the provisions of City of Tracy Municipal Code
Section 9.02.040

9.06.060 Amendments to the California Fire Code.
The City of Tracy hereby makes the following local amendments to the California Fire
Code:

CHAPTER 1

Section 103.2 Appointment, is hereby repealed in its entirety as it purports to
give vested employment rights different than currently exists for the fire code official.

Section 105.2.3 is amended to read as follows:
Section 105.2.3 Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for any
proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date
of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has
been issued; except that the fire code official is authorized to grant one or more
extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.
However, at the discretion of the fire code official, an application shall not be
extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent code, law or
ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application.

A new application shall be submitted and corresponding fees shall be paid when
an application for a permit has expired.

Section 105.3.2 is amended to read as follows:
Section 105.3.2 Extensions. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the
work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The
building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for



Ordinance 1274
Page 5

periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of the building official,
a permit shall not be extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent
code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A
new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall be paid when a permit
has expired.”

Section 105 is amended by adding subsection 105.6.50.1 to read as follows:
Section 105.6.50.1 Christmas tree lots, haunted house or corn maze. An operational
permit is required to operate a temporary or permanent operation.

Section 106 is amended by adding subsection 106.2.3 to read as follows:
106.2.3 Reinspection Fee. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection,
test, or reinspection when such portion of work for which an inspection is requested is
not complete or when corrections requested to be inspected are not made. This
section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time an
inspection or test is rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of the code,
but as controlling the practice of requesting inspections/tests before the job is ready
for such inspection or test. Reinspection fees may be assessed when the approved
plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failure to provide access on the
date for which the inspection/test is requested, failure for those individuals conducting
the testto show up at the scheduled time or deviating from the approved plans. The
fee shall be equal to all incurred costs for inspection and administrative staff at the
fully burdenedrate.

CHAPTER 2

Section 202 subsection FALSE ALARM is amended to read as follows:

FALSE ALARM shall mean the giving, signaling or transmission to any public fire
station or company or to any officer or employee thereof, whether by telephone,
spoken word or otherwise, information to the effect that there is a fire, medical
emergency, rescue request, or other need for emergency service at or near the place
indicated by the person giving, signaling, or transmitting such information, and there is
found to be no need for emergency services.

CHAPTER 3

Section 315 is amended by adding section 315.7.8 to read as follows:
Section 315.7.8 Outside storage of pallets, palletized packing boxes, bin boxes
and other combustibles.

Section 315.7.8.1 Operational permit required. An operational permit shall be
obtained to store pallets, palletized packing boxes, bin boxes and other combustible
materials in excess of 2500 cubic feet.

Section 315.7.8.2 Height
Pallets, palletized packing boxes, bin boxes and other combustible materials shall be



Ordinance 1274
Page 6

stored or piled with due regard to stability but in no case greater than 15 feet in
height.

Exception: Bin boxes may be stacked to a maximum height of 20 feet.

Section 315.7.8.3 Proximity to other combustible yard storage
Pallets, palletized packing boxes and bin boxes shall be stored within the limitations to
other combustible yard storage as per Table 315.7.8.3 (a). The distance of stacked
pallets, palletized packing boxes or bin boxes adjacent to buildings on the same lot
shall comply with Table
315.7.8.3 (b)

Table 315.7.8.3 (a)
Minimum distance of piled storage to other combustible yard

storage
# of Pallets Bins or boxes Min. Ft.
<50 20 Feet
50-200 30 Feet
>200 50 Feet

Table 315.7.8.3 (b)
Minimum distance of piled or combustible storage to buildings

Building Wall Construction # of Pallets, Bins or Boxes
<50 50-200 |>200

Masonry without openings 0 ft. 0 ft. 15 ft.

Wood or metal With 10 ft. 20 ft 30 ft.

outside sprinklers

Wood, Metal or Masonry 20 ft. | 30 ft. 50 ft.

W/QO outside sprinklers

Section 315.7.8.4 Proximity to property line
Where pallets, palletized packing boxes, bin boxes or other combustibles are piled or
stored adjacent to a property line, the distance from such storage or pile shall not be
less than 20feet to the property line.

Section 315.7.8.5 Fire access
Fire access driveways between and around pallets, palletized packing boxes, bin
boxes or other combustibles shall be a minimum of 20 feet in width and maintained
free from accumulation of rubbish, weeds, machinery, equipment or other
obstructions that may block access or add to the fire hazard. Driveways shall be
spaced so as to establish a maximum grid of storage not to exceed 50 feet by 50 feet
and no pile shall exceed 2500 square feet in dimension or more than 50 feet in any
one dimension. An approved turning radius around such piles shall be maintained at



Ordinance 1274
Page 7

all times.

Section 315.7.8.6 Fencing
Outside storage of pallets, palletized packing boxes, bin boxes or other combustibles
operating under a permit shall be enclosed by a suitable fence not less than 6 feet in
height.

Section 315.7.8.7 Water Supply
An approved water supply and hydrants capable of supplying the required fire flow
shall be provided within 400 feet or all portions of the storage area in accordance with
section 507 of the 2019 California Fire Code or NFPA 1142 (where municipal water
supplies are not available).

CHAPTER 4

Section 401.5 is amended by adding subsection 401.5.1 Cost to read as follows:
Section 401.5.1 Cost recovery. All costs incurred by the City to any response to a
false alarm will be charged to that person, property owner, firm or corporation
causing the transmission of the false alarm.

CHAPTER 5

Section 503.6 is amended to read as follows:
Section 503.6 Security gates. The installation of security gates across a fire
apparatus access road shall require, prior to installation, approval by the fire code
official. Where security gates are installed they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be
maintained operational at all times. All electrically operated automatic gates across
fire apparatus access roads shall be equipped with traffic preempting optical signal
receivers compatible with the emitters utilized by the Fire Department, which will
activate the gate and override all command functions of the gate controller. Knox
Switches shall be provided at automatic gates. The traffic preemptive optical signal
receiver and key switch shall be provided on both sides of an automatic access gate
where an exit loop is not provided. The automatic gate shall have a battery backup or
manual mechanical disconnect readily accessible to emergency personnel in case of
power failure. All gates must meet Fire Department standards deemed necessary by
the fire code official for rapid, reliable access. Electric gate operators, where
provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.
Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed
to comply with the requirements of ASTM F 2200. All manual gates shall be
equipped with a Knox-Box containing a key to the gate, or an approved Knox-
Padlock.

Section 505.1 is amended to read as follows:



Ordinance 1274
Page 8

Section 505.1 Address Identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided
and maintained with approved address identification. The identification shall comply
with all of the following:
1. Not less than 4" high with a 1/2" stroke width
2. Located minimum of 6' above grade
3. llluminated at night. Illumination shall be either internally or externally at an
intensity of 5.0 foot-candles
4. Numbers shall contrast with the background.
5. Numbers shall be placed on a portion of the building that is both legible and
visible from the street that fronts the property
6. Numbers shall not be placed on a moveable door and shall not be
obstructed from view from the street.
7. Addresses shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters and conventional
in form

Additionally, where access is by means of a private road and/or the building address
cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other approved sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Where required by the fire code official,
address numbers/figures shall be provided in additional approved locations to
facilitate emergency response.

Multiple tenant spaces serviced by vehicular access to the rear of the building
through any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall have numbers or addresses
placed prior to occupancy on all new and existing buildings as to be plainly visible
and legible from the rear access way.

Multiple tenant spaces serviced by rear access through a corridor, exit court, or exit
yard shall have approved numbers or addresses displayed on the rear of the tenant
space.

Multiple tenant spaces that front on interior walkways or pedestrian malls shall have
approved numbers or addresses placed over the entrance door in all new and
existing buildings. An illuminated annunciator or directory board shall be required at
every entrance where deemed necessary by the fire code official.

Section 506.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 506.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is
restricted because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for
life safety or firefighting purposes, the fire code official is authorized to require a key
box in which all keys necessary for entering any portion of the property, building or
area shall be contained. The key box shall be manufactured by Knox (listed in
accordance with UL 1037) and as a minimum size, shall be a Knox-Box 3200 series
box with exterior dimensions of 5"x4”x3 %4”. Larger boxes will be required dependent



Ordinance 1274
Page 9

upon the number of keys to be set within the box. The Knox-Box shall be installed at
a height of 72” above finished grade in an accessible location approved by the fire
code official. Keys within the box shall be permanently and readily identified.

Section 506 is amended by adding subsection 506.3 to read as follows:
Section 506.3 Hazardous materials management plan box. When a facility stores or
uses hazardous materials, the fire code official may require the installation of a
secured box manufactured by KNOX and located at the facilities primary entrance
or fire control room. The plan box shall contain up-to-date hazardous materials
inventory sheets (HMIS) of all of the hazardous materials stored or used within the
facility, hazardous materials management plan (HMMP) and contact information of
the company liaison to the fire department. The plan box shall be water proof and of
sufficient size to contain HMMP and HMIS information without the need to fold the
documentation.

Section 509 is amended by adding subsection 509.3 to read as follows:
509.3 Fire Control Room. All new buildings protected with an automatic fire
extinguishing system shall be provided with a Fire Control Room in which shall
contain system control valves and where practical, fire alarm panel, smoke exhaust
controls and all other equipment (excluding fire pump) as designated by the fire code
official. If the electrical power equipment is not located within the Fire Control Room,
then, it shall be located in a roomimmediately adjacent thereto or as approved by the
fire code official. The fire control room shall be located so as to be directly accessible
from the exterior of the building and provided with a durable and permanent sign on
the exterior of the access door to identify the space as the fire control room.

CHAPTER 9

Section 903 is amended by adding subsection 903.2.20 to read as follows:
Section 903.2.20 Automatic fire sprinklers. In addition to the requirements specified in
Section 903 of this code, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout and maintained in operable condition in the following buildings:

1. Every building hereafter constructed in which the total area of the building is
greater than 6,000 square feet including overhangs.

2. Every building hereafter constructed of three or more stories in height as
defined in the building code.

3. Every building hereafter remodeled or improved within a three-year period of time
when the cost of improvements (alterations and/or structural repairs to the
building) requiring permits exceeds a valuation threshold as specified below and
the total area of the building exceeds 6,000 square feet.

The calculation is determined using a valuation threshold of $100,000 based on
the 1985 “ENR US20 Cities” Average Construction Cost Index of 4195 adjusted by
area cost factors. The City will annually update the valuation threshold to a current
amount based on the increase in the index since the last figure used.

4. Every building hereafter changed in occupancy classification and the total area



Ordinance 1274
Page 10

is greater than 6,000 square feet, and the proposed use is deemed to be more
hazardous based on risk analysis by the fire code official

5. Every building hereafter in which square footage is increased by 50% or more
within a three- year period and the total square footage of the building exceeds
6000 square feet. If the additional square footage added to a building creates a
total that exceeds the minimum code requirement for sprinklers for that occupancy
type, then automatic sprinklers shall be required.

6. (Exception) Minor additions; not greater than 500 square feet in area to
existing non- sprinklered buildings and the purpose of the addition is for
accessory storage or disabled access upgrades.

Section 912.5 is amended to read as follows:
Section 912.5 Signs. A metal sign with raised letters at least 1 inch (25 mm) in size
shall be mounted on all fire department connections serving automatic sprinklers,
standpipes or fire pump connections. Such signs shall read: AUTOMATIC
SPRINKLERS or STANDPIPES or TEST CONNECTION or a combination thereof
as applicable. Where the fire department connection serves a portion of a building
or a specific building among multiple buildings a sign shall be provided to reflect the
appropriate building or portion of a building served.

Section 913 is amended by adding the following text to the end of the section:
Section 913.7 Meters and testing devices. Where fire pumps are provided, they shall
have a test loop installed in accordance with the applicable portions of NFPA 20
Section4.21.2.

CHAPTER 11

Section 1103.2 amended to read as follows:
Section 1103.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Existing
buildings that do not have approved radio coverage for emergency responders within
the building based upon the existing coverage levels of the public safety
communication systems of the jurisdiction shall be equipped with such coverage
when any of the following conditions apply:

1. Where the use or occupancy group of the building has been changed and the use
or occupancy is more hazardous.

2. Where the addition of metal racking systems, equipment, or interior walls utilizing
metal, masonry or concrete materials that interfere with emergency responder
radio coverage within the building as noted below:

a. Where multiple tenant spaces exist within a single structure, only the tenant
space where improvements are made that trigger radio coverage shall have
radio coverage. The improvements made to provide adequate radio
coverage shall be designed, however, to have the capability to expand
indoor radio coverage to all other areas of the building by adding cable and
antennas if needed for subsequent improvements in these other areas of
the building. Survivability of the cable pathway and “junction” locations
between tenant spaces shall be addressed.



Ordinance 1274

Page 11

b. New metal racks (including required aisle and flue space) or equipment

installed that increase existing metal racks (including required aisle and flue
space) or equipment by 40% or greater of tenant spaces up to 100,000
square feet, 35% or greater of tenant spaces up to 400,000 square feet and
25% or greater of tenant spaces greater than 400,000 square feet shall
require radio coverage.

New metal racks (including required aisles and flue spaces) or equipment
that cover 30% or greater area of the tenant space where no such
improvements previously existed shall require radio coverage in tenant
spaces up to 100,000 square feet; 25% or greater of tenant spaces up to
400,000 square feet and 20% or greater of tenant spaces greater than
400,000 square feet.

New masonry or concrete walls and elevated floor/ceilings and metal-
framed walls or floor/ceilings installed that increase existing masonry or
concrete walls and elevated floor/ceilings and metal-framed walls and
floor/ceilings (area calculation) by 40% or greater of tenant spaces up to
100,000 square feet, 35% or greater of tenant spaces up to 400,000 square
feet and 25% or greater of tenant spaces more than 400,000 square feet
shall require radio coverage.

New masonry or concrete walls and elevated floor/ceilings and metal-
framed walls or floor/ceilings installed that cover 30% or greater area of the
tenant space (area calculation) where no such improvements previously
existed shall require radio coverage in tenant spaces up to 100,000 square
feet, 25% or greater of tenant spaces up to 400,000 square feet and 20% or
greater of tenant spaces more than 400,000 square feet.

3. Every building hereafter in which square footage of the building is increased by
50% or more within a three-year period and the total square footage of the building
exceeds 10,000 square feet.

Exception: 1). Group R Division 3 Occupancies and buildings constructed
entirely of structural members made of wood.

APPENDIX B

Section B105.2 is amended by adding the following text to the end of
the section: Exception:

5. A maximum reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50 percent, as

approved by the fire code official, is allowed when the building is provided with
an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1
or 903.3.1.2 as opposed to the 75% reduction values given for minimum fire
flows in Table B1105.2. A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 75 percent,
as approved by the fire code official, is allowed for warehouse buildings of
Type |, Type Il, and Type Il construction provided with ESFR automatic fire
sprinkler systems. The resulting fire-flow for any of these reductions shall not
be less than 1500 gallons per minute for the prescribed duration according to
Table B105.1(2). Reduction of fire-flow applies to the fire hydrants
requirements as specified in Appendix C.



Ordinance 1274
Page 12

APPENDIX BB

Section BB105.1 and Exception is amended to read as follows:
Section BB105.1 The minimum fire-flow and flow duration for school buildings
shall be as specified in Table BB105.1.
Exception: A reduction in required fire flow of up to 50 percent is allowed when the
building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system. When a reduction
in fire flow is used, fire flow shall not be less than 1500 gallons per minute for the
prescribed duration as specified in Table BB105.1. Reduction of fire-flow applies to
the fire hydrants requirements as specified in Appendix CC.

APPENDIX C

Appendix C is amended by adding section C106 to read as follows:

Section C106 Hydrant type. The fire code official shall approve the type of fire
hydrants to be installed in the public right of way or on private property prior to any
suchinstallation.

Table C102.1 Number and Distribution of Fire Hydrants, footnote “b” is
repealed and amended to read as follows:

Table C102.1 footnote “b”
b. Where streets are provided with median dividers that make access to hydrants
difficult, cause time delay, or create undue hazard or both, or where arterial streets
are provided with four or more traffic lanes, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on
each side of the street and be arranged on an alternating basis.

APPENDIX CC

Appendix CC is amended by adding section CC106 to read as follows:
Section CC106 Hydrant type. The fire code official shall approve the type of fire
hydrants to be installed in the public right of way or on private property prior to any
suchinstallation.

Table CC105.1 Number and Distribution of Fire Hydrants, footnote “b” is
repealed and amended to read as follows:
Table CC105.1 footnote “b”
b. Where streets are provided with median dividers that make access to hydrants
difficult, cause time delay, or create undue hazard or both, or where arterial streets
are provided with four or more traffic lanes, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on
each side of the street and be arranged on an alternating basis.



Ordinance 1274
Page 13

SECTION 5: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.08.010,
9.08.020,
9.08.040, 9.08.060 and 9.08.080 through 9.08.160 are readopted in their entirety
without change.

SECTION 6: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.08.030,
9.08.050 and 9.08.070 are hereby amended to read as follows:

9.08.030 Adoption by reference of the California Electrical Code.
The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Electrical
Code," copyrighted by the National Fire Protection Association and approved by the
California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Electrical Code"),
as amended by this chapter. The California Electrical Code is on file with the City
Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance with Government
Code section 50022.6.”

9.08.050 Amendments to the California Electrical Code
The City hereby makes the following local amendments to the California Electrical
Code

SECTION 250.52(A)(5) AND 250.52(A)(7)

Section 250.52(A)(5) and 250.52(A)(7) is amended to read as follows:

Section 250.52(A)(5) Rod and Pipe Electrodes. Rod and pipe electrodes shall be not
less than 2.44 m (8 ft) in length and shall consist of the following materials.

(a) Grounding electrodes of pipe or conduit shall not be smaller than metric
designator 21 (trade size %) and any piping subject to undue corrosive
action, shall be listed for corrosive soils or protected in a manner suitable for
the purpose and is subject to the approval of the Building Official.

(b) Rod-type grounding electrodes of stainless steel and copper coated steel
shall be at least 15.87 mm (5/8-inch) in diameter, unless listed for corrosive
soils, unless listed.

Section 250.52(A)(7) Plate Electrodes. Each plate electrode shall expose not
less than 0.186 m?2 (2 ft?) of surface to exterior soil. Electrodes of electrically
conductive coated iron or steel plates, shall be at least 6.4 mm (1/4 inch) in thickness
and listed for corrosive soils. Electrodes of bare ferrous plates shall not be permitted.
Solid, uncoated electrodes of non-ferrous metal shall be at least 1.5mm (0.06 in) in
thickness.

9.08.070 Corrosive Soils.
The City of Tracy has extensive areas where corrosive soils are present and therefore
any ferrous or galvanized conduit, piping, connections or equipment in contact with the
ground shall be appropriately protected unless otherwise listed.

SECTION 7: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.10.010,
9.10.0209.10.040 and are readopted in their entirety without change.



Ordinance 1274
Page 14

SECTION 8: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.10.030 and
9.10.050 are hereby amended to read as follows:

“9.10.030 Adoption by reference of the California Residential Code. The City
hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Residential Code" and
appendices H, I, O, R, S, W and X copyrighted by the International Code Council
and the California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California
Residential Code"), as amended by this chapter. The California Residential Code is
on file with the City Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance
with Government Code section

50022.6.”

9.10.050 Amendments to the California Residential Code
The City hereby makes the following local amendments to the California Residential
Code

CHAPTER 1

Section R105.2 item 1 is amended to read as follows:
1. One-story detached accessory structures, provided that the floor area dies not
exceed 120 square feet (11.15 m?) and the story height does not exceed 11 feet 7
inches.

Section R105.2 item 2 is amended to read as follows:
2. Fences meeting all the following
1. Not exceeding 7 feet
2. Not used as a pool, spa or hot tub barrier
3. When constructed of concrete or masonry shall not exceed 4 feet in
height above adjacent finished grade level.

Section R105.3.2 is amended to read as follows:
Section R105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for any
proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of
filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been
issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of
time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of
the building official, an application shall not be extended morethan two times if this
code or any other pertinent code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to
the date of application. A new application shall be submitted and corresponding fees
shall be paid when an application has expired.

Section R105.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work
on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 daysafter the time the work is commenced. The



Ordinance 1274
Page 15

building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for
periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of the building official,
a permit shall not be extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent
code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A
new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall be paid when a permit has
expired.

CHAPTER 3
Table R301.2(1) is amended to read as follows:

Table R301.2(1)
Climatic and geographic design Criteria

GRO Wind design SEISMI| SUBJECT TO (WIN ICE FLOO| AIR [MEA
UND Spe(Topogr|Spe| Wind C  |weath|Fro| Ter|TER|BARRIER| D |FREE| N
SNO ed‘| aphic |cial|borne DESIG ering” | nt mite* DES|UNDERLAJHAZA| ZING |ANN
0 |110] NO |NO| NO | D1-D2 |Negligi|NA|Very|36.6 NO See |3 Deg|60.7
hi Ll N t C D N
MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA"
Elevation |Latitu| Winter | Summer [Altitude| Indoor Design Heating
de [heatina| coalina |correcti| desian | temnerature [temoerature
140 38 32 94 1.0 70 75 38
Cooling Wind | Wind |Coincident| Daily | Winter Summer
temneratire |velocitlvelocitv| wet hulbh | Ranae [hiimiditv humiditv
19 15 7.5 69 38 50% 50%

Note: For flood hazards, refer to Flood Insurance Rate Maps, 2009, published by
FEMA. Most of Tracy is in Zone X, outside the 0.1 % annual-chance floodplain.
General area lying north of 1-205 and small portions at the south edge of Tracy are in
the 1% annual chance of 100-year floodplain, and in the 200-year floodplain published
by the Department of Water Resources.

Section R319 is amended to read as follows:

R319 Address Identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided and
maintained with approved address identification. The identification shall comply with
all of the following

1. Not less than 4" high with a 1/2" stroke width

2. Located minimum of 6' above grade

3. llluminated at night. Illumination shall be either internally or externally

at an intensity of 5.0 foot-candles

4. Numbers shall contrast with the background.

5. Numbers shall be placed on a portion of the building that is both

legible and visible from the street that fronts the property

6. Numbers shall not be placed on a moveable door and shall not be



Ordinance 1274
Page 16

obstructed from view from the street.
7. Addresses shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters and
conventional in form.

Additionally, where access is by means of a private road and/or the building address
cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other approved sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Where required by the fire code official,
address numbers/figures shall be provided in additional approved locations to
facilitate emergency response.

Multiple residential units serviced by vehicular access to the rear of the
buildings through any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall have numbers or
addresses placed prior to occupancy on all new buildings as to be plainly visible and
legible from the rear access way.

APPENDIX X

Section AX108.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

AX108.2.4 Loft Guards. Loft guards shall be located along the open side of
lofts. Loft guards shall not be less than 42 inches (914 mm) in height. Loft guards shall
not have openings from the walking surface to the required guard height that allow
passage of a sphere 4 inches (102 mm) in diameter.

SECTION 9: Added Section. Section 9.10.060 of the Tracy Municipal Code is
hereby added to read as follows:

9.10.060 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire suppression systems.

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-
family dwellings including all newly installed manufactured homes in accordance with
Title 25

SECTION 10: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.12.010,
9.12.020, 9.12.040 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 11: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.12.030
and 9.12.050 are amended to read as follows:

9.12.030 Adoption by reference of the California Plumbing Code.

The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California
Plumbing Code," including appendices A, B, C, D, E, G, H, I, J and K, copyrighted
by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials and the
California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Plumbing Code"),
as amended by this chapter. The California Plumbing Code is on file with the City
Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance with Government



Ordinance 1274
Page 17

Code section 50022.6.”

9.12.050 Amendments to the California Plumbing Code
The City of Tracy hereby makes the following local amendments to the California
Plumbing Code.

CHAPTER 1

Section 104.3.3 is amended to read as follows:
Section 104.3.3 Time Limitation of Application. An application for a permit for any
proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of
filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been
issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of
time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of
the building official, an application shall not be extended morethan two times if this
code or any other pertinent code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to
the date of application.

A new application shall be submitted and corresponding fees shall be paid when an
application has expired.

Section 104.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 104.4.3 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless
the work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after
its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The
building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for
periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and
justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of the building official, a
permit shall not be extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent
code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A
new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall be paid when a permit has
expired.

Section 104.4.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section 104.4.4 Extensions. A permittee holding an unexpired permit shall
be permitted to apply for an extension of the time within which work shall be permitted
to commence under that permit where the permittee is unable to commence work
within the time required by this section. The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be
permitted to extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding 180
days upon written request by the permittee showing that circumstances beyond the
control of the permittee have prevented the action from being taken. However, at the



Ordinance 1274
Page 18

discretion of the building official, a permit shall not be extended more than two times if
this code or any other pertinent code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent
to the date of application. A new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall
be paid when a permit has expired.

SECTION 12: Added section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.12.060 is
added to read as follows:

9.12.060 Corrosive Solls.
The City of Tracy has extensive areas where corrosive soils are present and therefore
any ferrous or galvanized conduit, piping, connections or equipment in contact with the
ground shall be appropriately protected unless otherwise listed.

SECTION 13: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections
9.14.010,9.14.020 and 9.14.040 are readopted in their entirety without
change.

SECTION 14: Amended section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.14.030 is
hereby amended to read asfollows:

9.14.030 Adoption by reference of the California Green Building Standards
Code The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California
Green Building Standards Code" without appendices and copyrighted by the
California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Green Building
Standards Code"), as amended by this chapter. The California Green Building
Standards Code is on file with the City Clerk, and is available for inspection and
copying in accordance with Government Code section 50022.6.”

SECTION 15: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections
9.16.010,
9.16.020 and 9.16.040 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 16: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.16.030
and 9.16.050 are hereby amended to read as follows:

“9.16.030 Adoption by reference of the California Mechanical Code.

The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California
Mechanical Code," and appendices D and F attached thereto, copyrighted by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials and the California
Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Mechanical Code"), as
amended by this chapter. The California Mechanical Code is on file with the City
Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance with Government
Code section 50022.6.”



Ordinance 1274
Page 19

9.16.050 Amendments to the California Mechanical Code.
The City of Tracy hereby make the following local amendments to the
California Mechanical Code:

CHAPTER 1

Section 104.3.3 is amended to read as follows:
Section 104.3.3 Time Limitation of Application. An application for a permit for any
proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of
filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been
issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of
time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of
the building official, an application shall not be extended more than two times if this
code or any other pertinent code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to
the date of application. A new application shall be submitted and corresponding fees
shall be paid when an application has expired.

Section 104.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 104.4.3 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless
the work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after
its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 daysafter the time the work is commenced. The
building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for
periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and
justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of the building official, a
permit shall not be extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent
code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A
new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall be paid when a permit has
expired.

Section 104.4.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section 104.4.4 Extensions. A permittee holding an unexpired permit shall
be permitted to apply for an extension of the time within which work shall be permitted
to commence under that permit where the permittee is unable to commence work
within the time required by this section. The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be
permitted to extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding 180
days upon written request by the permittee showing that circumstances beyond the
control of the permittee have prevented the action from being taken. However, at the
discretion of the building official, a permit shall not be extended more than two times if
this code or any other pertinent code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent
to the date of application. A new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall
be paid when a permit has expired.



Ordinance 1274
Page 20

SECTION 17: Added section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.16.060 is
hereby added to read as follows:

9.16.060 Corrosive Soils.
The City of Tracy has extensive areas where corrosive soils are present and
therefore any ferrous or galvanized ducting, conduit, piping, connections or equipment
in contact with the ground shall be appropriately protected unless otherwise listed.

SECTION 18: Amended section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.40.050 (c)
(4) is hereby amended to read as follows:

Size, location and lighting. New and existing buildings shall be provided and
maintained with approved address identification. The identification shall comply with
all of the following
1. Not less than 4" high with a 1/2" stroke width
2. Located minimum of 6' above grade
3. llluminated at night. lllumination shall be either internally or externally at an
intensity of 5.0 foot-candles
4. Numbers shall contrast with the background.
5. Numbers shall be placed on a portion of the building that is both legible and
visible from the street that fronts the property
6. Numbers shall not be placed on a moveable door and shall not be
obstructed from view from the street.
7. Addresses shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters and conventional
in form

Additionally, where access is by means of a private road and/or the building address
cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other approved sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Where required by the fire code official,
address numbers/figures shall be provided in additional approved locations to
facilitate emergency response.

Multiple tenant spaces serviced by vehicular access to the rear of the building
through any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall have numbers or addresses
placed prior to occupancy on all new and existing buildings as to be plainly visible
and legible from the rear access way.

Multiple tenant spaces serviced by rear access through a corridor, exit court, or exit
yard shall have approved numbers or addresses displayed on the rear of the tenant
space. Multiple tenant spaces that front on interior walkways or pedestrian malls
shall have approved numbers or addresses placed over the entrance door in all new
and existing buildings. An illuminated annunciator or directory board shall be
required at every entrance where deemed necessary by the fire code official.

SECTION 19: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.48.010,



Ordinance 1274
Page 21

9.48.020 and 9.48.040 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 20: Amended section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.48.030 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

9.48.030 Adoption by reference of the California Historical Building Code.

The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Historical
Building Code" including all appendices attached thereto and copyrighted by the
California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Historical Building
Code"), as amended by this chapter. The California Historical Building Code is on file
with the City Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance with
Government Code section 50022.6.”

SECTION 21: Readopted section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.50.010,
9.50.020 and 9.50.040 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 22: Amended sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.50.030 and
9.50.050 are amended to read as follows:

9.50.030 Adoption by reference of the California Existing Building Code.

The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Existing
Building Code", without appendices, copyrighted by the International Code Council
and the California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Existing
Building Code"), as amended by this chapter. The California Existing Building Code is
on file with the City Clerk, and is available for inspection and copying in accordance
with Government Code section 50022.”

9.50.050 Amendments to the Existing Building Code.
The City of Tracy hereby makes the following local amendments to the Existing
Building Code.

CHAPTER 1

Section 105.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 105.3.2, Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for
any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the
date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has
been issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more
extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.
However, at the discretion of the building official, an application shall not be
extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent code, law or
ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A new
application shall be submitted and corresponding fees shall be paid when an



Ordinance 1274
Page 22

application has expired.

Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the
work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The
building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for
periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated. However, at the discretion of the building official,
a permit shall not be extended more than two times if this code or any other pertinent
code, law or ordinance has been adopted subsequent to the date of application. A
new permit shall be obtained and corresponding fees shall be paid when a permit
has expired.

SECTION 23: Amended section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.52.150 (c) (1)
is hereby amended to read as follows:

New construction and substantial improvements shall have the lowest floor
elevation, including basement, elevated 1 foot or higher above the base flood
elevation. Nonresidential structures may meet the standards set forth in subsection
(3) of this subsection. Upon the completion of the structure, the elevation of the lowest
floor, including basement, shall be certified by a registered professional engineer or
verified by the community building inspector to be properly elevated. Such certification
or verification shall be provided to the Floodplain Administrator.

SECTION 24: Readopted sections. Tracy Municipal Code sections 9.64.010,
9.64.020 and 9.64.040 are readopted in their entirety without change.

SECTION 25: Amended section. Tracy Municipal Code section 9.64.030 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

9.64.030 Adoption by reference of the California Energy Code.
The City hereby adopts by reference the code entitled "2019 California Energy Code,"
without appendices, published by the International Code Council and copyrighted by
the California Building Standards Commission (hereinafter "California Energy Code"),
as amended by this chapter. The California Energy Code is on file with the City Clerk,
and is available for inspection and copying in accordance with Government Code
section 50022.6.”

SECTION 26: Title, chapter and section headings. Title, chapter, and section
headings contained herein shall not be deemed to govern, limit, modify, or in any
manner affect the scope, meaning or intent of the provisions of any title, chapter, or
section hereof.



Ordinance 1274
Page 23

SECTION 27: Constitutionality. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or
phrase of this Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional, such
decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of the Ordinance.

SECTION 28: Effective date. This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30)
days after its final passage and adoption.

SECTION 29: Publication. A summary of this ordinance shall be published and
a certified copy of the full text posted in the office of the City Clerk at least five days
before the City Council meeting at which the proposed ordinance is to be adopted.
Within 15 days after adoption, the City Clerk shall publish a summary, and shall post
in her office a certified copy, of the ordinance with the names of those Council
Members voting for and against the ordinance. (Government Code section
36933(c)(1).)

* * % * * * % *

The foregoing Ordinance 1274 was introduced at a regular meeting of the Tracy
City Council on the 5" day of November, 2019, and finally adopted on the 19t day of
November, 2019, by the following vote:

AYES: COUNCIL MEMBERS: ARRIOLA, RANSOM, VARGAS, YOUNG,
RICKMAN
NOES: COUNCIL MEMBERS: NONE

ABSENT: COUNCIL MEMBERS: NONE
ABSTAIN: COUNCIL MEMBERS: NONE

SIGNED BY: Robert Rickman, Mayor

ATTEST: Adrianne Richardson, City Clerk





