
ORDINANCE NO. 1873 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MONTROSE, COLORADO, ADOPTING THE 1997 
UNIFORM FIRE CODE WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS. 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTROSE, 
COLORADO, AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 1 Section 7-4-1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

7-4-1: ADOPTION OF CODES 

(A) There is hereby adopted for the purpose of providing minimum standards to 
prevent fires, protect persons and property and to promote the public health, 
safety and welfare, The Uniform Fire Code, 1997 Edition, including 
Appendix Chapters 1-A through VII, and The Uniform Fire Code 
Standards. 1997 Edition, both published by the International Fire Code 
Institute, the subject matter of which is comprehensive regulations for the 
prevention of fire. 

(B) One copy of each of the above codes are on file in the office of the City 
Clerk and may be inspected during regular business hours. 

SECTION 2 Section 7-4-2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

7-4-2: GENERALPROVISIONS 

(A) The provisions of this Chapter and the Codes, adopted by reference herein, 
may be administered and enforced by the Chief of the Montrose Fire 
Protection District. The City Manager is also authorized to administer and 
enforce the provisions of this Chapter and the Codes adopted by reference 
in the event of the failure, refusal or inabiiity of the Chief to do so, or as 
convenient and appropriate in conjunction with the administration and 
enforcement of City Building, Zoning, or other Ordinances and regulations. 

(B) Whenever the word 11 jurisdiction 11 is used in The Uniform Fire Code, it shall 
mean the City of Montrose, Colorado. 



(C) The following amendments or clarifications to the Uniform Fire Code shall 
apply: 

(1) A new Section 103.3.5 is added to read as follows: 

103.3.5 Inspection Fees. 

A schedule of inspection fees shall be established by the Montrose 
Fire Protection District and approved by the City, which fee 
schedule may be amended from time to time upon prior City 
approval. The schedule shall be available at the Montrose Fire 
Protection District and the City of Montrose Engineering 
Department. 

(2) Section 103.4.1.1 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 103.4.1.1 Authorization to Issue Corrective Orders and 
Notices. 

When the Chief and or the City Engineer finds in any building or on 
any premises combustible, hazardous or explosive materials or 
dangerous accumulations of rubbish; or finds unnecessary 
accumulations of wastepaper, boxes, shavings or any highly 
flammable materials which are so situated as to endanger life or 
property; or finds obstructions to or on fire escapes, stairs, 
passageways, doors or windows that interfere with the operations of 
the Fire Dep~rtment or the safe and emergent exit of occupants of 
such premises; or finds that the effectiveness of any exit door, attic 
separation or any fire separation wall is diminished so as to 
constitute a violation of this Code; or finds that this Code is being 
violated in any way, the Chief is authorized to issue corrective 
orders as necessary for the enforcement of these provisions. 

(3) Section 103.4.1.3 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 103.4.1.3 Stopping Uses Evacuation 

The Chief is authorized to order an operation or use stopped or the 
evacuation of any premises, building or vehicle or portion thereof 
which has or is a fire hazard or hazard to life. 

(4) Section 105.6 is amended by the addition of the following 
paragraph: 



The requirements for permits from other agencies or departments 
shall not waive the requirements for permits required by this Code. 

(5) Section 105.8 is amended by the addition of the following 
paragraphs: 

g.l. Gates. A Fire Department permit is required to install or alter 
a gate or gate operator which obstructs a fire apparatus access 
road. 

x.l. Fire Extinguishing Systems and Equipment. A Fire Department 
permit is required to install, extend, or alter fire extinguishing 
systems and equipment; fire alarm systems, equipment and 
monitoring; smoke control systems and equipment 

x.2. Spray Booths. A Fire Department permit is required to install, 
extend, or alter a spray booth. 

x.3. Installation I Removal of aboveground and underground tanks. 
A Fire Department permit is required to install, extend, or 
alter aboveground or underground tanks used to contain 
flammable materials. 

(6) Article 2 Definitions is amended by the addition of the following 
terms and definitions: 

FALSE ALARM is the activation or reporting, whether intentional 
or not intentional, of an alarm when no such alarm condition, 
fire or emergency actually exists. 

FIRE LANES are Fire Apparatus Access Roads as designated by 
the Montrose Fire Protection District pursuant to UFC 

FIREWOOD SALES & STORAGE OF WOOD is any property 
used for the cow..mercial sale or storage of firewood or wood 
products 

KNOX BOX is a key lock box, type specified by the Montrose Fire 
Protection District 

NUISANCE ALARM is any alarm caused by mechanical failure, 
malfunction, improper installation, or lack of proper 



maintenance, or any alarm activated by a cause that cannot be 
determined. 

SMOKE CONTROL, DEDICATED SYSTEMS are intended for 
the purpose of smoke control only. They include separate 
systems of air moving and distribution equipment that do not 
function under normal building operating conditions. Upon 
activation, these systems operate specifically to perform the 
smoke-control function. 

SMOKE CONTROL, NON-DEDICATED SYSTEMS are those 
systems that share components with some other system(s) 
such as building HV AC systems. Activation causes the 
system to change its mode of operation to achieve the smoke­ 
control objective. 

TUNNEL is any thoroughfare, public way, walk way, or 
mechanical I electrical service conduit of dimensions to 
permit human occupancy for the purpose of service or repair, 
or conveyance of goods and persons, and which is 
constructed below grade and cannot be classified as the 
basement or first story of a building. 

(7) A new Section 901.7 is added to read as follows: 

901.7 Access Gates 

901.7.1 Permit. A Fire Department Permit is required prior to 
installing a gate or gate operator, which may serve to obstruct a fire 
apparatus access road. All access gates will meet the specifications 
of the Montrose Fire Protection District. 

(8) Section 1001.3 Plans is amended as follows: 

1£\r\.1 ...., 1 ,..., ___ ......_ ........... 1 r"'-----1-+- -1.-..n..., ..... ..-..A ..,....,..,.,~+~r'lnf.~- ........ n .1+:v"".1   .. !-l.ll~rn--'.1 .. 
1 UU 1..) ,1. Ut;Ht;HH, \.....UH!pu;u; p1a li:l il.HU i:~pv1.-l.l.li.-UUV1Ji> - - ~~ 

systems; fire extinguishing systems, including automatic sprinklers 
and wet/dry standpipes; halon systems and other special types of 
nnf-r......,nt.n f,.,.<> avt.ncrn,.,h1ncr ""CtPmc• n~cPmPnt nlnP ln1P.t~· finn OthP.r 
Q.ULVJ.J.J.Ul.J.""' J.J.J.'-' \,.r.AL.J..I..lf>U.I.~.I.J...I.J.J.t;> UJUL.V.&.&J.u, '-''""'u-.a..a.&--.a..a."' .t' ... .t'_.- .a..a..a.a._,.,.._,, --. ... - _.,..._ ... -·  .... 

fire protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall be submitted 
to the Fire Department for review and be approved prior to system 
installation. 

Approved plans shaH be kept readily available on the job site. 



All high rise, covered mall and atrium buildings, in addition to other 
major facilities as determined by the Chief, shall have a Fire and 
T 1-f<3 c;;:<>-f<3h7 P<:>,..fr<:>n-<3 R<3nnrt "nh-rn1tt<3rl tn. th<3 P11"<3 P1"<3U<3nt1nn T.ln1"<3<>11 
..L.I.l..I..V UU..L""IL.J ..&. U."".l.lo..'-"f,V .&."-'-',t'V.LL 0\A.lJ.I..I..LI.'-""""" L'-' "J..I......, ..&. ~""" .L ... .._,T""'.I..I.r....I.V.I..I. LIU..I.""'U.Y. 

and be approved prior to construction. 

1001.3.2 Plans, Alarm Systems. Complete plans and specifications 
for alarm systems shall include, but not be limited to, a floor plan; 
location of all alarm-initiating and alarm-signaling devices; alarm 
control and trouble-signaling equipment; annunication; power 
connection; battery calculations; conductor type and sizes; voltage 
drop calculations; and manufacturer, model numbers and listing 
information for all equipment, devices and materials. 

(9) Section 1001.5.2 Inspection and Testing is amended by adding one 
new sub-section as follows: 

1001.5.2.1 Fire Protection System. All Fire Protection Systems shall 
be maintained in accordance with the provisions of the Colorado 
Division of Fire Safety. A copy of said inspection shall be mailed 
within 48 hours, to the Fire Prevention Bureau only when any 
deficiency of the system or violation of the Fire Code is noted. In 

the Fire Prevention Bureau shall be notified by the service company 
within 24 hours. 

(10) Section 1001.5.3.1 Problematic Systems and Systems Out of Service 
is amended as follows: 

In the event of a failure of a fire protection system or recurring false 
or nuisance alarm activation's, the Chief is authorized to require the 
building owner or occupant to provide firewatch personnel until the 
system is repaired. 

(11) Section 1003.1.1 Fire Extinguishing Systems is amended as follows: 

Main control valves for fire extinguishing systems shall be: 

Located in a room with a one-hour occupancy separation and an 
exterior door, or equipped with exterior indicator posts (wall control 
valves) 

(12) Section 1003.1.2 Fire Extinguishing Systems is amended as follows: 



1003.1.2 Standards. Fire extinguishing systems shall be in 
accordance with the applicable NFPA Standards. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

1. No change-same as published in 97 UFC 
2. Change the word "Building Official" to "City Engineer and or 

Fire Chief" 
3. Occupancies that are not electrically monitored shall provide 

an approved identification sign below each outside horn and 
strobe, which reads \VHEN ALARl\1 SOUNDS - CALL 9-1-
1. This sign shall be of durable material with permanent 
lettering having a 2" minimum height on a contrasting 
background. 

(13) A new Section 4502.2.11 Location Prohibited is added as follows: 

Section 4502.2.11 Location Prohibited. Spray booth(s) designed for 
utilizing flammable or combustible liquids, or the application of 
combustible powders regulated by Article 45 shall not be located 
outside of buildings. 

(14) Section 4901.1 Hot Work, Scope is amended by adding a new 
second exception as follows: 

EXCEPTION 2 Group R-3 and U occupancies 

(15) Section 7701.7.2 Explosive Materials, Limits Established by Law is 
amended as follows: 

Explosive materials shall be stored only in areas zoned and approved 
for such use and shall be subject to approval by the Fire Chief. 

(16) A new Section 7801.3.3 Fireworks, Permits for Sale and Storage of 
Fireworks is added as follows: 

The Sale and Storage and Public Display of fireworks within the 
City limits shall require a permit by the Montrose Fire Protection 
District. 

(17) Article 90 Standards is amended by adding a new Section as follows: 

Section 9004 - NFP A Standards 



The most current editions of the National Fire Protection Association 
(NFPA) Standards referenced in this section are declared to be part 
of this code as if set forth in full herein. 

NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION STANDARDS 

NFP A 1 0; Portable Fire Extinguishers, 1997 Edition 

NFPA 13; Installation of Sprinkler Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFP A 13D; Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two­ 
Family Dwellings and Mobile Homes, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 13R; Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to and 
including four Stores in Height, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 14; Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 17; Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 1994 Edition 

NFPA 17A; Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 1994 Edition 

NFP A 20; Installation of Centrifugal Fire Pumps, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 22; Water Tanks for Private Fire Protection, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 24; Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their 
Appurtenances, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 25; Inspection, Testing and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire 
Protection Systems, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 72; National Fire Alarm Code, 1996 Edition 

NFP A 92A, Smoke Control Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 92B; Smoke Management Systems in tv1alls, Atria, Large 
Areas, 1995 Edition 

Cooking Operations; 1994 Edition 



NFPA 99C; Standard on Gas and Vacuum Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 11 0; Emergency and Standby Power Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFP A 231; General Storage, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 231C; Rack Storage of Materials, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 231D; Storage of Rubber Tires, 1994 Edition 

NFPA 231F; Storage of Rolled Paper, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 1123; Outdoor Display of Fireworks, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 1126; Use of Pyrotechnics before a Proximate Audience, 
1996 Edition 

NFP A 2001; Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems, 1996 Edition 

(18) Appendix III-B Fire Hydrants and Distributions is amended as 
follows: 

Section 3 Fire Hydrant Distribution 

The number and spacing of fire hydrants shall meet the approval of 
the Fire Chief. Fire hydrants shall be located adjacent to and 
accessible from fire apparatus access mads. Fire hydrants shall be 
spaced along fire apparatus access roads as follows: 

1. In developments wherein all lots are at least one acre but less 
than three acres in area, and the fire-flow requirement is equal 
to 1,750 gpm or less, a minimum of one fire hydrant shaH be 
nlaced an avera2:e of everv one thousand 0.000) feet. r --- - - -- -- - '-' ,., .... , , 

2. In developments where all lots are three acres or more and the 
fire-flow requirement is equal to 1,750 gpm or less, a 
minimum of one fire hydrant shall be placed an average of 
every fifteen hundred ( 1 ,500) feet. 

3. In developments where any lots are less than one acre and the 
fire-flow requirements is equal to 1,750 gpm or less, 
Appendix III-B and the accompanying Table A-III-B-1 shall 
apply. 



4. Any changes in lot sizes of developments shall trigger the 
applicable requirements herein. 

The following appendices are adopted by reference: 

I-C Stairway Identification; II-B Protection of Flammable and 
Combustible Liquid Tanks in Locations Subject to Flooding; II-C 
Marinas; 11-D Rifle Ranges; 11-E Hazardous Materials Management 
Plans and Hazardous Materials Inventory Statements; II-F Protected 
Aboveground Tanks for Motor Vehicle Fuel-Dispensing Stations 
Outside Buildings; 11-G Secondary Containment for Underground 
Tank Systems Containing Flammable or Combustible Liquids; II-H 
Site Assessments for Determining Potential Fire and Explosion 
Risks from Underground Flammable or Combustible Liquid Tank 
Leaks; II-I Ozone Gas- Generating Equipment; II-J Storage of 
Flammable and Combustible Liquids in Tanks Located with Below-
n .. arl.,. '-Tanltc• TTLA P1r,::> PlrmT "RPrm1rPmPntc fnr Rllllrlino-c• TTT-R 
'-11.1.." ........ '-' "1' """U.I..I.U' .&..&..&. .Z. 1 ..L .&..&.- 4 ..1.."-' YT ..L""-_'1._.&..&.-.&.&..a.-.a.&.""U ..&.-.&. .-..--.a  ..&.-..&.a  ..a.e-...,, ..&...L.&- .-

Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution; VI-A Hazardous Materials 
Classification; VI-B Hazard Ranking; VI-C Emergency Relief 
Venting for Fire Exposure for Aboveground Tanks; and VI-F 
Recommended Separation Distances for Explosive Materials. 

(D) If there is any conflict of any provisions of this Chapter or any Codes 
adopted by reference herein with any other provision of any ordinance of 
the City or other applicable State or Federal Regulations, those regulations 
providing the more stringent or more strict requirements shall apply. 

SECTION 3. A new Chapter 6-6 is hereby added: 

CHAPTER6 

OPEN BURNING 

6-6-1: GENERAL PROVISIONS 

It shall be unlawful for the owner, lessee or occupant of any property to bum or allow the 
burning of rubbish, wastepaper, wood, or other flammable material on any open premises, or on 
any public street, alley, or other land adjacent to such premises, subject to the following 
exemptions: 



(A) 

(B) 

(C) 

SECTION 4: 

Open burning may be allowed, subject to the issuance of permit by the Montrose 
Fire Protection District in accordance with Sections 1101, 1102 and 1103 of the 
1997 Uniform Fire Code, for the following uses: 

(1) agricultural open burning, defined as the open burning of cover vegetation 
for the purpose of preparing the soii for crop production and weed control; 

(2) fires for instructional or training purposes; 

Open burning may be allowed, without permit by the Montrose Fire Protection 
District, for fires used exclusively for the cooking of food for persons, when the 
following criteria are all met: 

(1) Such burning is limited in scope, intensity and duration to that minimally 
necessary to accomplish such purposes; 

(2) Such burning is confined to metallic barbeque pits, metallic barbeque 
equipment and other metallic food heat-processing equipment; 

(3) Fire-extinguishing equipment must be readily available; and 

(4) The burning is constantly attended by a person knowledgeable in the use 
of the fire-extinguishing equipment. 

Open burning in violation of the requirements set forth herein is hereby declared 
to be a nuisance and subject to abatement action by the City in any lawful manner 
inducting the procedures specified in Chapter 4 of this Title. 

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances is 
held invalid, such invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of the Ordinance 
which can be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this end the 
provisions of this Ordinance are declared to be severable. 



INTRODUCED, READ and PASSED on first reading this 6th day of December, 2001. 

Carlos R. Guara, J\1ayor 

ATTEST: 

Mary L. Watt, City Clerk 

You will please take notice that the Montrose City Council will hold a hearing upon the 
above Ordinance and on the auestion of its adoption on second readin2 on Thursdav. December 
20th, 2001 at the hour of 7:00p.m. at Montrose City Hall in Montrose, Colorado. -. 

INTRODUCED, READ and ADOPTED on second reading this 20th day of December, 
2001. 

Carlos R. Guara, Mayor ""'""' 

ATTEST: 

Sharleen R. WalkJr, Deputy City Clerk 



ORDINANCE NO. 1873 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MONTROSE, COLORADO, ADOPTING THE 1997 
UNIFORM FIRE CODE WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS. 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTROSE, 
COLORADO, AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 1 Section 7-4-1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

7-4-1: ADOPTION OF CODES 

(A) Tnere is hereby adopted for the purpose of providing minimum standards to 
prevent fires, protect persons and property and to promote the public health, 
safety and welfare, The Uniform Fire Code. 199t---7Edition, including 
Appendix Chapters 1-A through VI-Fl, and The Uniform Fire Code 
Standards. 199! ?Edition, both published by the International CaBfeFeBee 
af BuildiBg OffieialsFire Code Institute, S3ct0 Saut11 ~'aFlaB:aB ·Mill 
Road, 'Nhittief', CalifoFaia 90ct01, the subject matter of which is 
comprehensive regulations for the prevention of fire. (OFd. 1SOS,4 7 94) 

(B) One copy of each of the above codes are on file in the office of the City 
Clerk and may be inspected during regular business hours. A.dditiaaal 
eapies af'e available fof' puFehase. (OFEI. lSOS, 4 7 94) 

SECTION 2 Section 7-4-2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

7-4-2: GENE!LA T. PROVISIONS 

(A) The provisions of this Chapter and the Codes, adopted by reference herein, 
may be administered and enforced by the Chief of the Montrose Fire 
Protection District. The City Manager is also authorized to administer and 
enforce the provisions of this Chapter and the Codes adopted by reference 
in the event of the failure, refusal or inability of the Chief to do so, or as 
convenient and appropriate in conjunction with the administration and 
enforcement of City Building, Zoning, or other Ordinances and regulations. 

(B) Whenever the word "jurisdiction" is used in The Uniform Fire Code, it shall 



mean the City of Montrose, Colorado. 

(C) The limits referred to in Seetion 79.5Ql ofThe Uniform Fire Coae in vkieh 
the storage of Class I ana Class II liEJ:Hias in aeove groHRa taBks oHtsiae of 
euilaings is prohieitea ineluaes all residential, eommereial ana eusiness 
zonmg aistriets ~(eept the "ll 3", General Commereial Distriet.(Ora. 15Q5, 
4 7 94). The following amendments or clarifications to the Uniform Fire 
Code shall apply: 

ill A new Section 103.3.5 is added to read as follows: 

103.3.5 Inspection Fees. 

A schedule of inspection fees shall be established by the Montrose 
Fire Protection District and approved by the City, which fee 
schedule may be amended from time to time upon prior City 
approval. The schedule shall be available at the Montrose Fire 
Protection District and the City of Montrose Engineering 
Department. 

ill Section 103.4.1.1 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 1 03.4.1.1 Authorization to Issue Corrective Orders and 
Notices. 

When the Chief and or the City Engineer finds in any building or on 
anv nremises comhustihle, ha7anious or exnlosive materials or 
dangerous accumulations of rubbish; or finds unnecessmy 
accumulations of wastepaper, boxes, shavings or any highly 
flammable materials which are so situated as to endanger life or 
property; or finds obstructions to or on fire escapes, stairs, 
passage\Va\'S, doors or \Vindovvs that interfere V·Jith the operations of 
the Fire Department or the safe and emergent exit of occupants of 
such premises; or finds that the effectiveness of any exit door, attic 
separation . or any fire separation wall is diminished so as to 
constitute a violation of this Code; or finds that this Code is being 

orders as necessary for the enforcement of these provisions. 

(3) Section 103.4.1.3 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 103 .4.1.3 Stopping Uses E.vacuation 



The Chief is authorized to order an operation or use stopped or the 
evacuation of any premises, building or vehicle or portion thereof 
which has or is a fire hazard or hazard to life . 

.{±) Section 105.6 is amended by the addition of the following 
paragraph: 

Ihe requirements for permits from other agencies or depmtments 
shall not waive the requirements for pem1its required by this Code. 

ill Section 105.8 IS amended by the addition of the following 
paragraphs: 

g.l. Gates. A Fire Department permit is required to install or alter 
a gate or gate operator which obstructs a tire apparatus access 
road. 

x.l. Fire Extinguishing Systems and Equipment. A Fire Department 
permit is required to install, extend, or alter fire extinguishing 
systems and equipment; fire alarm systems, equipment and 
monitoring; smoke control systems and equipment 

x.2. Spray Booths. A Fire Department permit is required to instalL 
extend, or alter a spray booth. 

x.3. Installation I Removal of aboveground and underground tanks. 
A Fire Denartment nermit is required to install, extend,. or 
alter aboveground or underground tanks used to contain 
tlammable materials. 

(Q} Article 2 Definitions is amended by the addition of the foliowing 
terms and definitions: 

FALSE ALARM is the activation or repmting, whether intentional 
or not intentional, of an alarm when no such almm condition, 
fire or emergency actually exists. 

FIRE LANES are Fire Apparatus Access Roads as designated by 
the Montrose Fire Protection District pursuant to UFC 
§90 1.4.2. 

FIREWOOD SALES & STORAGE OF WOOD is any propetty 
used for the commercial sale or storage of firewood or wood 



products 

KNOX BOX is a key lock box, type specified by the Montrose Fire 
Protection District 

NUISANCE ALARM is any alam1 caused by mechanical failure, 
malfunction, improper installation, or lack of proper 
maintenance, or any alarm activated by a cause that cannot be 
determined. 

SMOKE CONTROL, DEDICATED SYSTEMS are intended for 
the purpose of smoke control only. They include separate 
systems of air moving and distribution equipment that do not 
function under normal building operating conditions. Upon 
activation, these systems operate specifically to perform the 
smoke-control function. 

SMOKE CONTROL, NON-DEDICATED SYSTEMS are those 
systems that share components with some other system(s) 
such as building HV AC systems. Activation causes the 
system to change its mode of operation to achieve the smoke­ 
control objective. 

TUNNEL is any thoroughfare. public way, walk way, or 
mechanical I electrical service conduit of dimensions to 
permit human occupancy for the purpose of service or repair, 
or conveyance u. of u ,gQQds and persons, and which is 
constructed below grade and cannot be classified as the 
basement or first story of a building. 

ill A new Section 901.7 is added to read as follows: 

90 I. 7 Access Gates 

90 I. 7.1 Permit. A Fire Department Permit is required prior to 
installing a gate or gate operator, which may serve to obstruct a fire 
apparatus access roan. All ~ccess gatPs will meet the soecifications 
of the Montrose Fire Protection District. 

ill Section I 00 I.3 Plans is amended as follows: 

100 1.3 .1. General. Complete plans and specifications for ~larm 
systems; fire extinguishing systems, including automatic sprinklers 



and wet/dry standpipes; halon systems and other special types of 
automatic fire extinguishing systems; basement pipe inlets; and other 
fire protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall be submitted 
to the Fire Department for review and be approved prior to system 
installation. 

Approved plans shall be kept readily available on the job site. 

All high rise. covered mall and atrium buildings, in addition to other 
major facilities as determined by the Chief, shall have a Fire and 
Life Safety Package Report submitted to the Fire Prevention Bureau 
and be approved prior to construction. 

I 001.3.2 Plans, Alarm Systems. Complete plans and specifications 
for alarm systems shall include, but not be limited to, a floor plan; 
location of all alarm-initiating and alarm-signaling devices; alarm 
control and trouble-signaling equipment; annunication; power 
connection; battery calculations; conductor type and sizes; voltage 
drop calculations; and manufacturer, model numbers and listing 
information for all equipment, devices and materials. 

(2l Section 1001.5.2 Inspection and Testing is amended by adding one 
new sub-section as follows: 

I 001.5 .2.1 Fire Protection System. All Fire Protection Systems shall 
be maintained in accordance with the provisions of the Colorado 
Division of Fire Safety. i\. copz' of said inspection shall be mailed 
within 48 hours, to the Fire Prevention Bureau only when any 
deficiency of the system or violation of the Fire Code is noted. In 
the event a service/maintenance contract is canceled or not renewed, 
the Fire Prevention Bureau shall be notified by the service company 
vvitl1in 24 hours. 

(lQ} Section 1001.5.3 .1 Problematic Systems and Systems Out of Service 
is amended as follows: 

In the event of a failure of a fire protection system or recurring false 
or nuisance alarm activation's, the Chief is authorized to require the 
building owner or occupant to provide firewatch personnel until the 
system is repaired. 



Ql_)_ Section I 003.1.1 Fire Extinguishing Systems is amended as follows: 

Main control valves for fire extinguishing systems shall be: 

Located in a room with a one-hour occupancy separation and an 
exterior door. or equipped with exterior indicator posts (wall control 
valves) 

.Ll1} Section 1003.1.2 Fire Extinguishing Svstems is amended as follows: 

1 003.1.2 Standards. Fire extinguishing systems shall be m 
accordance with the applicable NFPA Standards. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

_L No change-same as published in 97 UFC 
2. Change the v_rord "Building Official" to "City Engineer and or 

Fire Chief' 
3. Occupancies that are not electrically monitored shall provide 

an approved identification sign below each outside horn and 
strobe, which reads WHEN ALARM SOUNDS - CALL 9-1- 
1. This sign shall be of durable material with permanent 
lettering having a 2" minimum height on a contrasting 
background. 

( 13) A new Section 4502.2.11 Location Prohibited is added as follows: 

Section 4502.2.11 Location Prohibited. Spray booth(s) designed for 
utilizing f1ammable or combustible liquids, or the application of 
combustible powders regulated by Article 45 shall not be located 
outside of buildings . 

.C.W Section 4901.1 Hot Work. Scope ts amended by adding a new 
second exception as follows: 

EXCEPTION 2 Group R-3 and U occupancies 

(.lil Section 7701.7.2 Explosive Materials, Limits Established by Law is 
amended as follows: 

Explosive materials shall be stored only in areas zoned and approved 
for such use and shall be subject to approval by the Fire Chief. 



(1_§_) A new Section 7801.3.3 Fireworks, Pem1its for Sale and Storage of 
Fireworks is added as follows: 

The Sale and Storage and Public Display of fireworks within the 
City limits shall reguire a permit by the Montrose Fire Protection 
District. 

Ll1} Article 90 Standards is amended by adding a new Section as follows: 

Section 9004- NFPA Standards 

The most current editions of the National Fire Protection Association 
CNFPA) Standards referenced in this section are declared to be part 
of this code as if set fm1h in full herein. 

NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION STANDARDS 

NFP A 1 0; Portable Fire Extinguishers, 1997 Edition 

NFPA 13; Installation of Sprinkler Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 13D; Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two­ 
Family Dwellings and Mobile Homes, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 13R; Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to and 
including four Stores in Height 1996 Edition 

NFPA 14; Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFP A 1 7; Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 1994 Edition 

NFP A 1 7 A; Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems. 1994 Edition 

NFPA 20; Installation of Centrifugal Fire Pumps, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 22; Water Tanks for Private Fire Protection, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 24; Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their 
Appurtenances, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 25; Inspection, Testing and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire 



Protection Systems, 1995 Edition 

NFP A 72; National Fire Alarm Code. 1996 Edition 

NFPA 92A. Smoke Control Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 92B; Smoke Management Systems m Malls, Atria, Large 
Areas, 1995 Edition 

NFP A 96; Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of Commercial 
Cooking Operations; 1994 Edition 

NFPA 99C; Standard on Gas and Vacuum Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 1 1 0; Emergency and Standby Power Systems, 1996 Edition 

NFPA 231; Gener::1l Storage. 1995 Edition 

NFPA 231 C; Rack Storage of Materials, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 231D; Storage of Rubber Tires, 1994 Edition 

NFPA 231F; Storage ofRolled Paper, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 1123; Outdoor Display of Fireworks, 1995 Edition 

NFPA 1126; Use of Pyrotechnics before a Proximate Audience, 
1996 Edition 

NFPA 2001; Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems, 1996 Edition 

( 18) Appendix JII-B Fire Hydrants and Distributions is amended as 
follows: 

Section 3 Fire Hydrant Distribution 

The number and spacing of Lire hydrants shall meet the approval of 
the Fire Chief. Fire hydrants shall be located adjacent to and 
accessible from fire apparatus access roads. Fire hydrants shall be 
spaced along fire apparatus access roads as follows: 

_L In developments wherein all lots are at least one acre but less 
than three acres in area, and the fire-flow requirement is equal 



to L750 gpm or less, a minimum of one fire hydrant shall be 
placed an average of eve1y one thousand (1,000) feet. 

2. In developments where all lots are three acres or more and the 
fire-flow requirement is equal to 1, 750 gpm or less, a 
minin1Urn of one fire hydrant shall be placed an average of 
every fifteen hundred (1.500) feet. 

3. In develooments where anv lots are less than one acre and the 
fire-flow requirements is equal to 1,750 gpm or less, 
Appendix III-B and the accompanying Table A-III-B-1 shall 

~ 

4. Any changes in lot sizes of developments shall trigger the 
applicable requirements herein. 

The following appendices are adopted by reference: 

f-C Stairway Identification; li-B Protection of Flammable and 
Combustible Liquid Tanks in Locations Subject to Flooding; II-C 
Marinas; li-D Rifle Ranges; II-E Hazardous Materials Management 
Plans and Hazardous Materials Inventmy Statements; II-F Protected 
Aboveground Tanks for Motor Vehicle Fuel-Dispensing Stations 
Outside Buildings; II-G Secondary Containment for Underground 
Tank Systems Containing Flammable or Combustible Liquids; II-H 
Site Assessments for Determining Potential Fire and Explosion 
Risks from Underground Flammable or Combustible Liquid Tank 
Leaks: II-I Ozone Gas- Generating Equi_Q_ment; II-J Storage of 
Flammable and Combustible Liquids in Tanks Located with Below­
Grade Vaults; III-A Fire Flovv Requiren1ents for Buildings; III~B 

Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution; VI-A Hazardous Materials 
Classification; VI-B Hazard Ranking; VI-C Emergency Relief 
Venting for Fire Exposure for Aboveground Tanks; and VI-F 
Recommended Separation Distances for Explosive Materials. 

The limits refcffed te iB 8eetieB 82.194(8) ef The UHifeffil Fire Cede iB 
·.vhieh the sterage ef liqc1ified petrelel:H11 gas is restrieted are hereby 
est&blished as fellews: 

All BusiBess, Cemmereial aBd R-esideBtial ZeBiBg Distriets e7(eept "B 3 ", 
General Cemmereial Distriets. (Ord. 1595,4 7 94) 



l f there is any conflict of any proviSions of this Chapter or any Codes 
adopted by reference herein with any other provision of any ordinance of 
the City or other applicable State or Federal Regulations, those regulations 
providing the more stringent or more strict reguirements shall apply. 

Tl1e lit11its referred to itt Seetiott 77.1G7(a) of The Uttifotttt Fire Code itt 

v;hieh the storage of eJf13losives af:I:Ei blastiag agents is prohibited are hereby 
established as follows: 

The entire City en:eept for "I 2" General Inffilstrial Distriets. (Ora. 15Q5. 4 
-+-941 

(19 If there is arlj' eonfliet of an-y provisions of this Chapter or arlj' Codes 
adopted by refurenee herein 'Nith aFI:Y other pro';ision of an-y orainaf:l:ee of 
the City or other applieable State or Federal Regulations, those regulations 
providing the more striagent or more striet reE]:uirements shall apply. (Ora. 
1257, 11 15 84) 

SECTION 3. A new Chapter 6-6 is hereby added: 

CHAPTER6 

OPEN BURNING 

6-6-i: GENERAL PROVISIONS 

It shall be unlawful for the owner, lessee or occupant of any property to burn or aiiow the 
burning of rubbish, wastepaper, wood, or other flammable material on any open premises, or on 
any public street, alley, or other land adjacent to such premises, subject to the following 
exemptions: 

(A) Open burning may be allowed, subject to the issuance of permit by the Montrose 
Fire Protection District in accordance with Sections II 0 I, II 02 and II 03 of the 
1997 Uniform Fire Code, for the following uses: 

(I) agricultural open burning, defined as the open burning of cover vegetation 
for the purpose of preparing the soi I for crop production, weed control, 
and other agricultural cultivation purposes; 

(2) fires for instructional or training purposes; 



(B) 

(C) 

SECTION 4: 

Open burning may be allowed, without permit by the Montrose Fire Protection 
District. for fires used exclusively for the cooking of food for persons, when the 
tal lowing criteria are all met: 

(I) Such burning is limited in scope, intensity and duration to that minimally 

(2) 

(3) 

(4) 

necessary to accon1plish such purposes; 

Such burning is confined to metallic barbeque pits, metallic barbeque 
equipment and other meta II ic food heat-processing equipment; 

Fire-extinguishing equipment must be readily available; and 

The hurnirw is const~ntlv attended lw a nerson knowledl!eable in the use ---- -- --o -- -- -------"' ---- "' ,- u 

of the fire-extinguishing equipment. 

Open burning in violation of the requirements set forth herein is hereby declared 
to be a nuisance and subject to abatement action by the City in any lawful manner 
including the pr-ocedures specified in Chapter 4 of this Title. 

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances is 
held invalid, such invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of the Ordinance 
which can be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this end the 
provisions of this Ordinance are declared to be severable. 

{)z IN~DUCED, READ and PASSED on first reading this {:, Y!l_ day of 
C. orry. 09eh , 200 1. 

Lk-~¢' 
Carlos R. Guara, Mayor 

ATIEST: 



You will please take notice that the Montrose City Council will hold a hearing upon the 
above Ordinance and on the question of its adoption on second reading on 
Thursday, I Q -d 0 , 2001 at the hour of 7:00 p.m. at Montrose City Hall in Montrose, 
Colorado. 

INTRODUCED, READ and ADOPTED on second reading this __ day of 
_______ ,2001. 

Carlos R. Guara, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

Mary L. Watt, City Clerk 


