ORDINANCE NO. O18-86

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
GLENDALE, MARICOPA COUNTY, ARIZONA, AMENDING
GLENDALE CITY CODE, CHAPTER 16 (FIRE PREVENTION
AND PROTECTION), ARTICLE I (TECHNICAL
STANDARDS) AND ARTICLE III (SPRINKLER SYSTEMS);
AND SETTING FORTH AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GLENDALE as follows:

SECTION 1. That the Glendale City Code Chapter 16, Article II is deleted in its entirety
and a new Article II is adopted and shall read as follows:

CITY CODE, CHAPTER 16, ARTICLE 11

Sec. 16-16. Adopted by reference; violation.

(@) The following publication(s), ONEthree (13) copYies of which |Sare on file in the office of the city
clerk, are hereby adopted by reference as if set out at length in this Code.

(1) 201809 International Fire Code, as published by the International Code Council, Inc.

(2) 201809 International Fire Code, Appendix Chapters B, C, D, E, F, H, I, K, and NJ; these
chapters may be use as acceptable alternate methods and optional considerations or
requirements as determined or approved by the Fire Code Official.

(b)  Any person violating any of the provisions of the publications adopted in subsection (a) shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor.

(Ord. No. 2750, § 1, 11-9-10)

Sec. 16-17. - Amendments to the 201809 International Fire Code.
The 201809 International Fire Code is hereby amended in the following respects:

Section 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. This Code shall be known as the Glendale Fire Code, may be cited as such and will be
referred to herein as "this Code".

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}




SECTION 105.6.30 IS HEREBY DELETED AND REPLACED WITH THE FOLLOWS:

105.6.30 MOBILE FOOD UNIT. MOBILE FOOD UNITS SHALL NOT BE REQUIRED TO OBTAIN A
SPECIAL PERMIT THAT IS NOT REQUIRED FOR OTHER MOBILE VENDING BUSINESSES. MOBILE
FOOD UNITS ARE REQUIRED TO BE INSPECTED BY A CITY OR TOWN FIRE DEPARTMENT
BEFORE OPERATION.

EXCEPTION: |F THE MOBILE FOOD VENDOR PROVIDES EVIDENCE THAT THE MOBILE FOOD
UNIT PASSED A FIRE INSPECTION BY ANOTHER CITY OR TOWN FIRE DEPARTMENT IN THIS
STATE WITHIN THE PRECEDING TWELVE MONTHS.

S%MMWM@'H‘%‘W’ j j i i T

SECTION 109 IS HEREBY DELETED AND REPLACED WITH THE FOLLOWING:

SECTION 109 BOARD OF APPEALS. APPEALS OF ORDERS, DECISIONS OR DETERMINATIONS
MADE BY THE FIRE CODE OFFICIAL RELATIVE TO THE APPLICATION AND INTERPRETATION OF
THIS CODE, SHALL FALL UNDER THE APPEALS PROCESS ADOPTED IN THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE AND AS ESTABLISHED BY CITY COUNCIL.

Section 110.4109-3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

110.44093 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Fire Code Official, or of a permit
or certificate used under provisions of this Code, shall be a Class 1 misdemeanor and punished as
Class 1 misdemeanor under state law. Each-day-any-violation-of any-provision-of this Code-orof any
Wm‘ i i O

Section 112.4111-4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

112.41444-4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with
a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition, shall be assessed a fee in accordance with the fees established by council
resolution for operating without a permit.

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



SECTION 903.2.13 1S HEREBY ADDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

903.2.13 NEW BUILDINGS WITH UNKNOWN OCCUPANCY TYPE OR HAZARD
CLASSIFICATION. IN NEW BUILDINGS CONSTRUCTED WITH AN INTERIOR CEILING/DECK
HEIGHT EXCEEDING 20 FEET AND THE OCCUPANCY OR HAZARD CLASSIFICATION IS
UNKNOWN, THE MINIMUM FIRE SPRINKLER DESIGN DENSITY CRITERIA SHALL BE .495/2000
SQUARE FEET.

Section 903.3.8 is hereby added to read as follows:

903.3.8 Access to fire sprinkler risers. Fire sprinkler risers shall be installed indoors and an exterior
door leading directly into the room containing the fire sprinkler riser and shut off controls shall be
provided.

Exception: An exterior door is not required when an approved alternate and accessible method of
controlling the sprinkler water supply from the outside of the structure is provided.

SECTION 1103.5.31S HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

1103.5.3 GROUP [-2, CONDITION 2. IN ADDITION TO THE REQUIREMENTS OF SECTION 1103.5.2,
EXISTING BUILDINGS OF GROUP 1-2, CONDITION 2 OCCUPANCY SHALL BE EQUIPPED
THROUGHOUT WITH AN APPROVED AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM IN ACCORDANCE
WITH SECTION 903.3.1.1. THE AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM SHALL BE INSTALLED
WITHIN 12 MONTHS OF WRITTEN NOTIFICATION.

EXAMPLE: GROUP I-2, CONDITION 2 OCCUPANCIES INCLUDE:

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



FACILITIES THAT PROVIDE NURSING AND MEDICAL CARE AND COULD PROVIDE EMERGENCY
CARE, SURGERY, OBSTETRICS, OR INPATIENT STABILIZATION UNITS FOR PSYCHIATRIC OR
DETOXIFICATION, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO HOSPITALS.

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}



SECTION 2. That Glendale City Code Chapter 16, Article III is hereby deleted in its entirety and
a new Article III is hereby adopted and shall read as follows:

CITY CODE, CHAPTER 16, ARTICLE III
Sec. 16-51. - Definitions.

(a) Terms defined in other codes; where words, terms and phrases not defined in this Code and
are defined in other currently adopted Codes, such words, terms and phrases shall have the
meaning ascribed to them in those codes.

(b) In addition, the following words, terms and phrases, when used in this article, shall have
the meanings ascribed to them in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a
different meaning:

Approval: Refers to approval by the Fire Code Official as the result of an official code
interpretation or code modification request or pursuant to investigation and tests or by
reason of accepted principles or tests by national authorities, technical or scientific
organizations.

Approved: Acceptable to the Fire Code Official.

This Code: Refers to the current adopted International Fire Code, amendments and
ordinances.

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}




Sec. 16-52. - General sprinkler system requirements.

In addition to the requirements of this Code, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be
required as follows:

(a) Throughout the entire building of all newly constructed commercial and residential
structures. Exceptions:
1. Where specifically omitted or otherwise not required in accordance with this Code.
2. In one- and two-family dwellings gnd-tewnhemes regulated by the International

Sec. 16-53. - Permissible sprinkler omissions.

(a) Sprinkler systems shall be designed on the basis of complete coverage with no unprotected
areas. However, sprinkler coverage may be omitted from certain areas where the application of
water may constltute a serious hfe or ﬁre hazard. Addmonally, sprmkler coverage may be

Fire Code Official.

(b) Unless the use of the facility otherwise requires; automatic fire sprinklers shall not be
required in the following areas:

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}

_ - { Formatted:

Strikethrough

4= /[ Formatted:

Underline

- { Formatted:

Underline

B \{ Formatted:

Underline

‘{ Formatted:

Underline

{ Formatted:

Underline

{ Formatted:

Strikethrough

o L L _J

_ - { Formatted:

Strikethrough

- { Formatted:

Strikethrough

- { Formatted:

Strikethrough

- { Formatted:

Strikethrough




- Detached non- combustlble canopies that do not exceed 5,000 square feet

— Exterior roofs, overhangs or canopies of type I, II or III construction with no
combustible storage beneath or those designed solely as pedestrian shade.

Note: For the purpose of this section, "detached" is defined as "a separate single-story building
or structure, without a basement or crawl space and located an approved distance from other
structures."”

(c) In addition to any automatic sprinkler system required by this Code, other approved
automatic fire protection systems may be installed to protect special hazards. These additional
systems shall not substitute for the required automatic sprinkler system without approval of the
Fire Code Official.

SECTION 3. That the-provisions—ef-this-ordinancebecome—elfectiveJuly+-2048-
provisions—of-this—erdinance—become—effeetiveJuly—1;2048provisions of this ordinance shall

become effective thirty (30) days after passage by the Glendale City Council.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED by the Mayor and Council of the City of
Glendale, Maricopa County, Arizona, this 11" day of December, 2018.

[Jerry P. Weiers]
Mayor Jerry P. Weiers

ATTEST:

[Julie K. Bower
Julie K. Bower, City Clerk (SEAL)

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}

{ Formatted: Strikethrough

{Formatted Strikethrough

{Formatted Strikethrough

{ Formatted: Underline

{ Formatted: Indent: Left: 63 pt, First line: 4.5 pt

- { Formatted: Strikethrough

B { Formatted: Centered




APPROVED AS TO FORM:

[Michael D. Bailey]
Michael D. Bailey, City Attorney

REVIEWED BY:

Kevin R. Phelps
Kevin R. Phelps, City Manager

[Additions are indicated by underline; deletions by strikeeut}




