
7/13/12 ’1/l/W/7‘/

ORDINANCE NO. /77’; 6 ‘Z
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF AMARILLO, TEXAS:

AMENDING THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF AMARILLO, CHAPTER 4-5, ARTICLE 

11, SECTION 4-5-21 BY REPEALING THE 2006 EDITION OF THE INTERNA TIONAL PLUMBING

CODE AND ADOPTING THE 2012 EDITION OF SUCH CODE, REGULATING AND

GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF MATERIALS, ERECTION,

INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION, RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT,

ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF PLUMBING SYSTEMS; PROVIDING FOR THE

ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY;

PROVIDING FOR REPEALER; PROVIDNG FOR CONTINUATION OF PRIOR LAW;

PROVIDING A PENALTY; PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION AND EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, upon the recommendation of the Construction Advisory and Appeals Board, the

City Commission finds that it is in the best interest of public health and safety to repeal the 2006

edition of the International Plumbing Code and to adopt the 2012 edition of the International

Plumbing code, regulating and goveming the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,

installation, alteration, repair, loeatio11, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of

plumbing systems; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees; and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF

AMARILLO, TEXAS:

SECTION 1. That the current Chapter 4-5, Article II, Section 4-5-21 be and hereby is repealed

in its entirety.

SECTION 2. That Chapter 4-5, Article II, Section 4-5-21 be and hereby is now re-enacted,

amended, to adopt the 2012 Edition of the lnternationtzl Plumbing Code with amendments, to read as

follows:

See. 4-5-21. Adoption of plumbing code and any applicable appendices,‘ amendments.

(a) Code adopted. There is hereby adopted the International Plumbing Code, 2012 edition

{published by the International Code Council) exclusive of its appendix chapters, with the following

amendments, copies of which shall be maintained by the building official:

Section l0l.l. Amend to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of City of

Amarillo hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section l06.6.l. Change to read as follows:

106.6.1 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work on a

plumbing system before obtaining the necessampennits shall be subject to fees as provided in

Chapter 4-1 of the Municipal Code of Ordinances.

Section lO6.6.2. Amend to read as follows:



Section 106.6.2 Fee schedule. The fees shall be as rovided in Cha ter 4-1 of the Munici al

Code of Ordinances.

Section l06.6.3. Delete section.

Section 108.4. Delete section.

Section 108.5. Amend to read as follows:

108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official,work on any plumbing system that

is being done contrapy to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall

immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the propmg,

or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions

under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not

be reguired to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall continue

any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such

work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be

liable for a fine as specified in the Municipal Code of Ordinances.

Section 305.4.l. Amend to read as follows:

305.4.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers shall be a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) below g1_'ade.

Section 312.2. Amend to read as follows:

312.2 Drainage and vent water test.

A water test shall be applied to the drainage system either in its entirety or in sections. If applied

to the entire system, all openings in the piping shall be tigl_1tly closed, except the highest opening,

and the system shall be filled with water to the point of overflow. If the system is tested in

sections eacho enin shall be ti tl lu ed exce tthe hi esto enin sof the section under

test and each section shall be filledwith water but no section shall be tested with less than a 5

foot 1 1524 mm) head of water. In testing successive sections, a lowest opening head test at each

floorlevel if multiple floors shall be tested at the plumbing rougl_1-in inspection. This test shall be

held for not less than 15 minutes.

Sections 312.10.] and 312.10.2. Amend to read as follows:

312.10.] Inspections. Annual inspections shall be made of all backflowprevention assemblies

and air gaps to determine whether they are operable. In the absence of local provisions, the owner

is responsible to ensure that testing is performed.

312.10.2 Testing. Reduced pressure principle backflow preventer assemblies, double check-

valve assemblies, pressure vacuum breaker assemblies, reduced pressure detector fireprotection

backflow prevention assemblies, double check detector fire protection backflow prevention



assemblies, hose connection backflowpreventers, and spill-proofvacuum breakers shall be tested

at the time of installation, immediately after repairs or relocation and at least armually. The

testing procedure shall be performed in accordance with applicable local provisions. In the

absence of local provisions, the owner is responsible to ensure that testing is done in accordance

with one of the following standards:

{stated list ofstandards is adopted as is, without change}

Section 702.1. Amend to read as follows:

702.1 Above-ground sanitagy drainage and vent pipe.

Above-ground soil, waste and vent pipe shall conform to one of the standards listed in Table

702.1.

Table 702.1 ABOVE-GROUND DRAINAGE AND VENT PIPE

—m STANDARD

Acgglonitrile butadiene stfiene {ABS} plastic pipe in IPS
. _

diameters, including schedule 40, DR 22 (PS 200) and ��Cj��9j�jg� _ ��Cj��9j�j{� 16218 
DR 24 {PS 140); with a solid or composite wall

'

Brass pipe
ASTM B 43

ASTM A 74' CISPI 301'

ASTM A 888

ASTM B 42' ASTM B 302

ASTM B 75' ASTM B 88'

ASTM B 251' ASTM B 306

ASTM A 53

Cast-iron pipe

Copper or copper-alloy pipe

Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K, L, M or DWV)

Galvanized steel pipe

Polyolefinpipe
CSA B181 '3

Polflinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipe in IPS diameters,

including schedule 40, DR 22 (PS 200) and DR 24 (PS

140); with a solid or composite wall

P01 in lchloride PVC lastic i e with a 3.25 inch
ASTM D 2949 ASTM F 1488

O.D. and a solid or composite wall

Stainless steel drainage systems, Types 304 and 316L
-ELSE‘

Section 702.2. Amend to read as follows:

ASTM D 2665' ASTM F 891‘

CSA Bl8l.2' ASTM F 1488

702.2 Underground building sanita1_'y drainage and vent pipe.

Underground building sanitm drainage and vent pipe shall conform to one of the standards listed

in Table 702.2.



TABLE 702.2 UNDERGROUND BUILDING DRAINAGE AND VENT PIPE

T —-“"”""“‘”

Acgglonitrile butadiene sggene (ABS) plastic pipe in IPS
_ _

diameters, including schedule 40, DR 22 (PS 200) and flail,1; égnélllg 16718 
DR 24 (PS 140); with a solid or composite wall

'

Casfiron i e

ASTM A 74' CISPI 301°
?—‘p‘L ASTM A 888

.
ASTM B 75' ASTM B 88'

Co er or co er allo tubin T e K L M or DWV
ASTM B 251_ ASTM B 306

_21-;___.I21L_y____g.(Jp_._.____)

Polyolefin pipe ASTM F 1412' CSA B] 81.3

1P0 in l chloride PVC lastic i e in IPS diameters
ASTM D 2665 AS 

. .

' TM F 891'

includiri schedule 40 DR 22 PS 200 and DR 24 PS
ASTM F 1488_ CSA B1812

_:_g__.__(:_l___£__

140); with a solid or composite wall

P01 in lchloride PVC lastic i ewith a 3.25 inch
ASTM D 2949 ASTM F 1488

O.D. and a solid or composite wal 1

Stainless steel drainage systems, Type 316L
j—"?ASMEA 1 12'3’1

Section 702.3. Amend to read as follows:

702.3 Building sewer pipe.

Building sewer pipe shall conform to one of the standards listed in Table 702.3.

TABLE 702.3 BUILDING SEWER PIPE

MATERIAL STANDARD

Acgglonitrile butadiene stfiene (ABS) plastic pipe
in IPS diameters, including schedule 40, DR 22 (PS

200) and DR 24 (PS 140); with a solid, or

composite wall

—A:1w_st<A-aemtmm ASTM C 428

C t
. .

ASTM A 74' ASTM A 888' CISPI

__5lS_'!.1fl.l3_1.l3_9 Ln-

Acgglonitrile butadiene styrene (ABS) plastic pipe
in sewer and drain diameters, including SDR 42 (PS

20), PS35, SDR 35 (PS 45), PS50, PS100, PSl40,

SDR 23.5 (PS 150) and PS200; with a solid or

composite wall

Polflinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipe in sewer and

drain diameters, including PS 25, SDR 41 (PS 28),

PS 35, SDR 35 (PS 46), PS 50, PS 100, SDR 26

(PS 115), PSl40 and PS 200; with a solid or

composite wal

ASTM C 14° ASTM C 76' CSA

1

Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K or L) ��Cj��9jR��y
B 75. ASTM B 88. ASTM

. .

_ Polyethylene (PE) plastic pipe (SDR PR)
ASTM F 714

Polyolefinpipe ASTM F 1412' CSA B18l.3

4

ASTM D 2661' ASTM F 628'

ASTM F 1488

ASTM F 1488‘ ASTM D 2751

ASTM F 891‘ ASTM F 1488'

ASTM D 3034‘ CSA B182.2‘ CSA

Bl82.4



Polflinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipe in IPS

diameters, including schedule 40, DR 22 {PS 200)

and DR 24 PS 140 ' with solid or com osite wall
CSA B1822 CSA B1814

Polflinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipe with a 3.25

inch O.D. and a solid or composite wall

Vitrified clay pipe

Section 903.1. Amend to read as follows:

903.1 Roof extension. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at least

12 inches (305 mm) above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any pugpose other

than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above the roof.

Section 918.3. Amend to read as follows:

918.3 Where permitted. Where approved by the code official, individual, branch and circuit

vents shall be permitted to terminate with a connection to an individual or branch-type air

admittance valve in accordance with Section 91 8.3.1. Stack vents and vent stacks shall be

permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance valves in accordance with Section 91 8.3.2.

SECTION 3. That the current Chapter 4-5, Article II, Section 4-5-22 (adopting Uniform

Swimming Pool, Spa, Hot Tub Code, with amendments) be and hereby is repealed entirely and said

section is now designated as “Reserved.”

SECTION 4. Severability. If any provision, section, subsection, sentence, clause or the

application of same to any person or set of circumstances for any reason is held to be unconstitutional,

void or invalid or for any reason unenforceable, the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance

or the application thereby shall remain in effect, it being the intent of the City Commission of the City

of Amarillo, Texas in adopting this ordinance, that no portion thereof or provision contained herein

shall become inoperative or fail by any reasons of unconstitutionality of any other portion or provision.

SECTION 5. Repealer. All ordinances, parts of ordinances resolutions and parts of resolutions

in conflictwith this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of conflictwith this ordinance.

SECTION 6. Continuation. That nothing in this ordinance or in any code hereby adopted shall

be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability

incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby

repealed by this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired

or affected by this ordinance.

ASTM D 2665' ASTM D 2949'

ASTM D 3034' ASTM F 1412'

ASTM D 2949 ASTM F 1488

Stainless steel draina e s stems T es 304 and
ASME A 1123.1

3l6L
:‘—'j‘-

ASTM C 425' ASTM C 700



SECTION 7. Penalty. It is an offense to violate any part of this ordinance, punishable upon

conviction in accordance with Section l-1-5 of thc Amarillo Municipal Code of Ordinances.

SECTION 8. Publishing and Effective Date. This ordinance shall be published according to

law and be effective on October 1, 2012.

INTRODUCED AND PASSED by the City Commission ofthe City of Amarillo, Texas, on

FirstReadingthisthe t dayof Q1 5% Lg-:1’ ,20l2;andPASSED on SecondandFinal

Reading the Li day of C;q’31§r‘[\Qr ,20l2.

\.lAi...li
Paul I-larpol(§Mayor

ATTEST:

Qggrgevs IA Lu;
E” Donna DeRight, City Secretary


