8/09/23
ORDINANCE NO. 8091

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
AMARILLO, TEXAS: AMENDING THE MUNICIPAL CODE
OF THE CITY OF AMARILLO, CHAPTER 4-5, ARTICLE II,
SECTION 4-5-21 BY REPEALING THE 2015 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE AND ADOPTING THE
2021 EDITION OF SUCH CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF
MATERIALS, ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION,
REPAIR, LOCATION, RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT,
ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF PLUMBING
SYSTEMS; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS
AND COLLECTION OF FEES; PROVIDING FOR
SEVERABILITY; PROVIDING FOR REPEALER; PROVIDNG
FOR CONTINUATION OF PRIOR LAW,; PROVIDING A
PENALTY; PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION AND
EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, upon the recommendation of the Construction Advisory & Appeals Board,
the City Council finds that it is in the best interest of public health and safety to repeal the 2015
edition of the International Plumbing Code and to adopt the 2021 edition of the International
Plumbing code, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance
of plumbing systems; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees; and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF AMARILLO, TEXAS:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 4-5, Article 11, Section 4-5-21 be and hereby is amended, to
adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Plumbing Code with amendments, to read as

follows:

Sec. 4-5-21. Adoption of plumbing code and any applicable appendices; amendments.

a) Code adopted. There is hereby adopted the International Plumbing Code, 2021
edition (published by the International Code Council), exclusive of its appendix chapters,
with the following amendments, copies of which shall be maintained by the building
official:

[Insert] to read as follows

1 Ord. 8091



Section 101.1. Amend to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of City of
Amarillo hereinafter referred to as "this code."

[Amend] to read as follows

102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code
shall be those that are listed in Chapter 15 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and
standards shall be considered as part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed
extent of each such reference and as further regulated in Section 102.8.1 and 102.8.2.

[strike]

[Amend] to read as follows
[A] 102.8.2 Provisions in referenced codes and standards WI:re.te-thee;ete1':|t—eJf—the—reiereru;eL

provisions-in-the referenced-code orstandard. -Whenever amendments have been adopted

to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be
considered to reference the adopted amendments. Any reference to NEPA 70 shall mean the
Electrical Code as adopted.

[Strike]

[Insert][Amend] 109.2 to read as follows

[A] 109 2 Schedule of permit fees. Where work requrres a permrt a fee for each permit shall
be pai : A : :
gevermng—euthenty as provrded in Chapter 4-1 of the Munrcrpal Code of Ordlnances

[Amend] as follows

[A]109.3 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work
on a plumbing system before obtalnlng the necessary permits shall be subject to fees as

established by 3 : Chapter
4-1, Article I, Division 1 Sectlon 4 1- 1 thru 4- 1 4 of the Clty of Amarrllo Municipal Code

2 Ord. 8091



[Amend][Delete]

Section 106:6-3 109.4. Fees. -Delete section.

Section 108:4- 109.5 Refunds -Delete section.

[strike]

Section-108-5-Amend-toread-asfolows: wording is in the 2021 IPC chapter 113

[Amend] to read as follows

[A] 113.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to

remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subjectto-fines-established-by-the-authority-
havingjurisdiction. liable for a fine as specified in the City of Amarillo Municipal Code of

Ordinances.

[Delete] section 114 Means of Appeals- delete entire section
[Insert] Section 114 Means of Appeal

Section 114 Means of Appeal

114.1 Application for appeal. Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the
Code Official to the Construction Advisory and Appeals Commission established by

Municipal ordinance. The Commission shall be governed by the enabling ordinance.
Section 305.4.1. Amend to read as follows

sept-m—tanleeenneeﬂen— BU|Id|ng sewers shall be a minimum of 12 lnches (305 mm) below

grade.
[Amend] Section 305.7 to read as follows

305.7 Protection of components of plumbing system. Components of a plumbing system
installed within 3’ along alleyways, driveways, parking garages or other locations_in a

3 Ord. 8091



manner in which they could be exposed to damage shall be recessed into the wall or
otherwise protected in an approved manner.

Section 312.2. Amend to read as follows:

312.2 Drainage and vent water test. A water test shall be applied to the drainage system
either in its entirety or in sections. If applied to the entire system, all openings in the piping
shall be tightly closed, except the highest opening, and the system shall be filled with water
to the point of overflow. If the system is tested in sections, each opening shall be tightly
plugged except the highest openings of the section under test, and each section shall be
filled with water, but no section shall be tested with less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of
water. In testing successive sections, a lowest opening head test at each floor level if
multiple floors shall be tested at the plumbing rough-in inspection. This test shall be held
for not less than 15 minutes.

[Strike] 312.9 from ordinance and code

Sections 312.10.1 and 312.10.2. Amend to read as follows:

312.10.1 Inspections. Annual inspections shall be made of all backflow prevention
assemblies and air gaps to

determine whether the assemblies are operable and air gaps exist. In the absence of local
provisions, the owner is responsible to ensure that testing is performed.

312.10.2 Testing. Reduced pressure principle, double check, pressure vacuum breaker,
reduced pressure detector fire protection, double check detector fire protection, and spill-
resistant vacuum breaker backflow preventer assemblies and hose connection backflow
preventers shall be tested at the time of installation, immediately after repairs or relocation
and at least annually. The testing procedure shall be performed in accordance with
applicable local provisions. In the absence of local provisions, the owner is responsible to
ensure that testing is done in accordance with one of the following standards: (stated list of
standards is adopted as is, without change.)

[Strike] the following from ordinance only. Tables to remain as published.(to allow use of
all code approved materials)

4 Ord. 8091



[Strike] from ordinance only

5 Ord. 8091




Section 903.1.1 Amend to read as follows:

903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be

termmated at least 12 mches (305 mm) above the roof. e;eeeupt—th-a{—whelﬁe-a—|c991f—ls—te-lae-lalsed—fmL

[Amend] to read as follows

918.3 Where permitted. Individual, branch and circuit vents shall be permitted to terminate with
a connection to an individual or branch-type air admittance valve in accordance with Section
918.3.1. Stack vents and vent stacks shall be permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance

6 Ord. 8091



valves in accordance with Section 918.3.2._Air admittance valves shall only be installed with the
prior approval of the Code Official.

[Amend] Section 1003.3 to read as follows

1003.3 Grease interceptors. Grease interceptors shall comply with the requirements of Sections-
100331 through

1003-3.8. Article IV- Environmental Health ; sec. 8-5-27 City of Amarillo Municipal Code of
Ordinances.

[Delete] sections 1003.3.1 through 1003.3.8

[Amend] to read as follows

1106.1 General. The size of the vertical conductors and leaders, building storm drains, building
storm sewers, and any horlzontal branches of such dralns or sewers shaII be based on six (6)
inches per hour he , ,

[Delete] entire section.-addressed elsewhere in municipal code

: bined:cani I bl

SECTION 2. Severability. If any provision, section, subsection, sentence, clause or the

application of same to any person or set of circumstances for any reason is held to be
unconstitutional, void or invalid or for any reason unenforceable, the validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance or the application thereby shall remain in effect, it being the intent of
the City Council of the City of Amarillo, Texas in adopting this ordinance, that no portion
thereof or provision contained herein shall become inoperative or fail by any reasons of
unconstitutionality of any other portion or provision.

SECTION 3. Repealer. All ordinances, parts of ordinances resolutions and parts of
resolutions in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of conflict with this
ordinance.

SECTION 4. Continuation. That nothing in this ordinance or in any code hereby adopted

shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired,

7 Ord. 8091



or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or
ordinance hereby repealed by this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any
character be lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.

SECTION 5. Penalty. It is an offense to violate any part of this ordinance, punishable

upon conviction in accordance with Section 1-1-5 of the Amarillo Municipal Code of
Ordinances.

SECTION 6. Publishing and Effective Date. This ordinance shall be published according

to law and be effective on October 1, 2023.
INTRODUCED AND PASSED by the City Council of the City of Amarillo, Texas, on
First Reading this the 26th day of September, 2023; and PASSED on Second and Final Reading

the 10th day of October, 2023.

Cole Stanley, Mayor
ATTEST:

Stephanie Coggins, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Bryan McWilliams, City Attorney

8 Ord. 8091



8/09/23

ORDINANCE NO. 8091

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
AMARILLO, TEXAS: AMENDING THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF
THE CITY OF AMARILLO, CHAPTER 4-5, ARTICLE II,
SECTION 4-5-21 BY REPEALING THE 205 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE AND ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF SUCH CODE, REGULATING AND GOVERNING
THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF MATERIALS,
ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR,
LOCATION, RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO,
USE OR MAINTENANCE OF PLUMBING SYSTEMS;
PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND
COLLECTION OF FEES; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY;
PROVIDING FOR REPEALER; PROVIDNG FOR
CONTINUATION OF PRIOR LAW; PROVIDING A PENALTY;
PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION AND EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, upon the recommendation of the Construction Advisory & Appeals Board, the
City Council finds that it is in the best interest of public health and safety to repeal the 2015 edition
of the International Plumbing Code and to adopt the 2021 edition of the International Plumbing
code, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation,
alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing
systems; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees; and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
AMARILLO, TEXAS:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 4-5, Article II, Section 4-5-21 be and hereby is amended, to
adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Plumbing Code with amendments, to read as follows:

Sec. 4-5-21. Adoption of plumbing code and any applicable appendices; amendments.

a) Code adopted. There is hereby adopted the International Plumbing Code, 2021
edition (published by the International Code Council), exclusive of its appendix chapters,

with the following amendments, copies of which shall be maintained by the building
official:

[Insert] to read as follows
Section 101.1. Amend to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of City of
Amarillo hereinafter referred to as "this code.”

[Amend] to read as follows

102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code
shall be those that are listed in Chapter 15 and such codes. when specifically adopted, and
standards shall be considered as part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed
extent of each such reference and as further regulated in Section 102.8.1 and 102.8.2.

[strike]

[Amend] to read as follows
[A] 102.8.2 Provisions in referenced codes and standards. Where the-extentof the-reference

1 Ord. 8091




previsions-in-the referenced code-or-standard. —Whenever amendments have been adopted
to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be
considered to reference the adopted amendments. Any reference to NFPA 70 shall mean the

Electrical Code as adopted.
[Strike]

[Insert]{Amend] 109.2 to read as follows

[A] 109 2 Schedule of per:mt fees Where work requlres a perrmt a fee for each perm1t shall
be paids . o he-sched . od byt
ge’vlemmg—au%heﬂ%y as prov1ded in Chapter 4-1 of the Mummpal Code of Ordmances

[Amend] as follows

[A]109.3 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work
on a plumbing system before obtalmng the necessary penrmts shall be SlleeCt to fees as

established by the-code : dition emit-fees-Chapter
4-1, Article I, Division J Sectton 4’ I-I tkm 4- 1 -4 of the C:ty ofAmar:llo Municipal Code

[Amend][Delete]

Section 106:6:3 109.4. Fees. -Delete section.

Section 1884-109.5 Refunds -Delete section.

[strike]

Seetion-108-5-Amend-toread-asfolloews: wording is in the 2021 IPC chapter 113

[Amend] to read as follows

[A] 113.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to

remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject-to-fines-established-by-the-autherity
havingjurisdietion. liable for a fine as specified in the City of Amarillo Municipal Code of

Ordinances.

[Delete] section 114 Means of Appeals- delete entire section
[Insert] Section 114 Means of Appeal

Section 114 Means of Appeal

2 Ord. 8091

i



114.1 Application for appeal. Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the
Code Official to the Construction Advisory and Appeals Commission established by

Municipal ordinance. The Commission shall be governed by the enabling ordinance.

Section 305.4.1. Amend to read as follows
305.4.1 Sewer depth. B

[T iNAH R1 i

a

septie-tanlk conneetion: Building sewers shall be a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) below
grade.

[Amend] Section 305.7 to read as follows

305.7 Protection of components of plumbing system. Components of a plumbing system
installed within 3° along alleyways, driveways, parking garages or other locations in a
manner in which they could be exposed to damage shall be recessed into the wall or
otherwise protected in an approved manner.

Section 312.2. Amend to read as follows:

312.2 Drainage and vent water test. A water test shall be applied to the drainage system
either in its entirety or in sections. If applied to the entire system, all openings in the piping
shall be tightly closed, except the highest opening, and the system shall be filled with water
to the point of overflow. If the system is tested in sections, each opening shall be tightly
plugged except the highest openings of the section under test, and each section shall be
filled with water, but no section shall be tested with less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of
water. In testing successive sections, a lowest opening head test at each floor level if
multiple floors shall be tested at the plumbing rough-in inspection. This test shall be held
for not less than 15 minutes.

[Strike] 312.9 from ordinance and code

Sections 312.10.1 and 312.10.2. Amend to read as follows:

312.10.1 Inspections. Annual inspections shall be made of all backflow prevention
assemblies and air gaps to

determine whether the assemblies are operable and air gaps exist. In the absence of local
provisions, the owner is responsible to ensure that testing is performed.

312.10.2 Testing. Reduced pressure principle, double.check, pressure vacuum breaker,
reduced pressure detector fire protection, double check detector fire protection, and spill-
resistant vacuum breaker backflow preventer assemblies and hose connection backflow
preventers shall be tested at the time of installation, immediately after repairs or relocation
and at least annually. The testing procedure shall be performed in accordance with
applicable local provisions. In the absence of local provisions, the owner is responsible to
ensure that testing is done in accordance with one of the following standards: (stated list of
standards is adopted as is. without change.)

[Strike] the following from ordinance only. Tables to remain as published.(to allow use of
all code approved materials)

3 Ord. 8091




4 Ord. 8091




PS140.and PS 200 witl T ; 1
251

Polyethylene-(PE) plastie-pipe (SBR-PR) ASTMEFHA

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipe in1PS di : ASTMD 2665 ASTM D 2949;

including schedule40, DR22(PS-200}-and- DR 24(PS ASTM D3034- ASTM E1412:-C5A

140);-with-selid-or compesite-wall B182.2; CSA-B183.4

Polyviryl chloride (BV.C) plastic pi o325 0 ASTM D 2049 ASTM E 1488

O.D-and-asolid-ercomposite-wall :

itrifiod clavoi ASTM C425: ASTM.C700

Section 903.1.1 Amend to read as follows:

903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be

terminated at least 12 inches (305 mm) above the roof. except-that-where-a-roefisto-be-usedfor
mm)-abeve theroof

[Amend) to read as follows

918.3 Where permitted. Individual, branch and circuit vents shall be permitted to terminate with
a connection to an individual or branch-type air admittance valve in accordance with Section
918.3.1. Stack vents and vent stacks shall be permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance
valves in accordance with Section 918.3.2._Air admittance valves shall only be installed with the
prior approval of the Code Official.

[Amend] Section 1003.3 to read as follows

1003.3 Grease interceptors. Grease interceptors shall comply with the requirements of Sections
100331 through

1003.3.8. Article IV- Environmental Health ; sec. 8-5-27 City of Amarillo Municipal Code of
Ordinances.

[Delete] sections 1003.3.1 through 1003.3.8

[Amend] to read as follows

1106.1 General. The size of the vertical conductors and leaders, building storm drains, building
storm sewers, and any horizontal branches of such drains or sewers shall be based on six (6)
inches per hour the 100-vear hourlyrainfall rate-indicated-in-Figure 1106-1-or on-otherrain

rates-determined from-approved-local-weather data-

[Delete] entire section.-addressed elsewhere in municipal code

SECTION 2. Severability. If any provision, section, subsection, sentence, clause or the
application of same to any person or set of circumstances for any reason is held to be
unconstitutional, void or invalid or for any reason unenforceable, the validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance or the application thereby shall remain in effect, it being the intent of the
City Council of the City of Amarillo, Texas in adopting this ordinance, that no portion thereof or
provision contained herein shall become inoperative or fail by any reasons of unconstitutionality of

any other portion or provision,

5 Ord. 8091




SECTION 3. Repealer. All ordinances, parts of ordinances resolutions and parts of
resolutions in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of conflict with this
ordinance.

SECTION 4. Continuation. That nothing in this ordinance or in any code hereby adopted

shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or

liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance L_j
hereby repealed by this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost,
impaired or affected by this ordinance.
SECTION 5. Penalty. It is an offense to violate any part of this ordinance, punishable upon
conviction in accordance with Section 1-1-5 of the Amarillo Municipal Code of Ordinances.
SECTION 6. Publishing and Effective Date. This ordinance shall be published according to
law and be effective on October 1, 2023.
INTRODUCED AND PASSED by the City Council of the City of Amarillo, Texas, on First

Reading this the 10th day of October, 2023; and PASSED on Second and Final Reading the 24th day

of October, 2023. / %
J

Cole Stanley, Mayor u

ATTEST:

Steph;ime Coggins, C1ty @e{fétary

APPROVED AS TO FO / )

>, —--’7/4 |

Bryat{ MQVilliams, City Attorney
i |
-

6 Ord. 8091





