
COUNCIL BILL NO. 2011-024 ORDINANCE NO.201 1-142

AN ORDINANCE amending Sec 26-67 of Chapter 26, Buildings and Building

Regulations, Article III., Building Code, ' Sec. 26-67.,
Amendments to the International Residential Code., for the

rmrrmse nf makino certain chnn aes to address issues related
vuv V- ---.-u‘..-

€0mtflC May 22, 20? lvtomado.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF

JOPLIN, MISSOURI, as follows:
'

Section 1. That Section 26-67. Amendments to the International Residential Code..

of the Jo1ilin(Cit—y code,14; aifiéildédie readlasrtollofnisiil
I I

“Sec. 26-67. Amendments to the International Residential Code.

The [residential] building code adopted by Section 26-66 of this article is hereby
amended, changed, and altered, as follows:

R101 .1 is amended bv inserting: lCitv of Jonlinl.
-_- . ... _- ...-----..-..

v’, ___._____c. I_._._,
-_ _

-r_____'.

' Rl04.ll is amended by adding the following paragraph to the existing

section:

The alternative method commonly known as "pole barn" or "laminated

pole" type structures shall be limited to commercial buildings and

accessory buildings only and not for residential dwelling units.

Rl05.2 is amended by deleting item 1 in its entirety.

Rl05.2 is amended by deleting item 2 in its entirety.

R105.2 is amended by deleting item 5 in its entirety.

R106 is deleted in its entirety.

R107.3 is amended by deleting "ICC Electrical Code" and replacing such

text with "2008 National Electrical Code."

Table R3012 (II is amended hv inserting: l30 lb Ground Snow Load. 906
_—._v ...v.....

\.I
-- ._-_---..-— -

........_._c. L.
- _- -_--.__-v ..__-

mph Wind Speed, B Seismic Design Category, Severe Weathering,’ ��Cj��9j�<�z

inches Frost line depth, moderate to heavy termite, slight to moderate

decay, 9, Dec. 8, 1976 Flood Hazards].



Council Bill No. 2010-024 (Continued)

R403.1.1 is amended by adding wording: "All footings for residential

construction are to be at least 16 inches in width‘ and eight inches in

thickness."

R403.1.6 Foundation anchorage is amended to read as follows:

“R403.1.6 Foundation anchorage. When braced wall panels are supported

directly on continuous foundations, the wall wood sill plate or cold-

formed steel bottom track shall be anchored to the foundation in

accordance with this section.

The wood sole plate at all exterior walls on monolithic slabs and wood sill

plates shall be anchored to the foundation with anchor bolts spaced a

maximum of 4 feet on center. There shall be a minimum of two bolts per

plate section with one bolt located not more than 12 inches (305 mm) or

less than seven bolt diameters from each end of the plate section. In

Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2, anchor bolts shall be spaced at

5 ‘F991’ (15170 rnrn\ nn rvr-Infpr and lnnnfprl uriflwin 1') inr-lune /Q04 rnm\ r\‘Ff1nt=
u J.\d\-ll: \L\JL4J 111.111] um; vvxnuvn u.u.\a Avvuvuu vvauuna 11. unvaxvo \J \J.I 111.111} \JJ. L119

ends ofeach plate section at interior braced wall lines when required by
Section R602.l0.9 to be supported on a continuous foundation. Bolts shall

be at least 1/2 inch (13 mm) in diameter and shall extend a minimum of 7

inches (178 mm) into masomy block cells filledwith concrete fiom the

footing up or concrete. Interior bearing wall sole plates on monolithic slab

foundation shall be positively anchored with approved fasteners. A nut

....J .......—L.... ..L..I‘I L- 4.Z..LL.....A ._ ...\..‘L L..‘I4. ..L‘A.‘I... ..‘I..A... C1111- .._...I ..-‘l._

'¢1.l.1U wusucr 5113111 UU L1g[1l.UIlCU U11 UEIUII UUIL U1 LIIC pl'c1l.C. D1115 'clIlU S016

plates shall be protected against decay and termites where required by
Sections R319 and R320. Cold-forrned steel framing systems shall be

fastened to the wood sill plates or anchored directly to the foundation as

required in Section R505:3.1 or R603.1.1.

Exceptions:

1. Foundation anchorage spaced as required to provide equivalent

anchorage to l/2-inch-diameter (13 mm) anchor bolts.

2. Walls 24 inches (610 mm) total length or shorter connecting

offset braced wall panels shall be anchored to the foundation with
a minimum of one anchor bolt located in the center third of the

plate section and shall be attached to adjacent braced wall panels
-‘In- an -

per J:"lgl1I'C KOUZJUJ at COI'IlCI'S.

2



Council Bill.No. 2010-024 (Continued)

3. Walls 12 inches (305 mm) total length or shorter connecting
offset braced wall panels shall be permitted to be connected to the

foundation without anchor bolts.

The wall shall be attached to adjacent braced wall panels per

Figure R602.10.5 at corners.”

Section R404.l.l Masonry foundation walls is amended to read as

follows:

"R404.1.1 Masonrv foundation walls. Concrete masonrv and cl av masnnrv
’
‘ ‘ " j " """"" """ "" ' '

""""—J
'—"'

""o'
""""'-'

foundation walls shall be constructed as set forth in Table R404.l .1 (1),
R404. 1

. 1(2), R404.1.1(3) or R404.1.1(4) and shall also comply with the

provisions of Section R404 and the applicable provisions of Sections

R606, R607 and R608. In Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2,

concrete masonry and clay masonry foundation walls shall also comply
with Section R404. 1 .4. Rubble stone masonry foundation walls shall be

nnncfrrinfprl in arr-nrflannp urifl-\ Qsanfinnc T3404 1 Q nnrl D507 9 7 D111-skin
uunnuu uuuuu 1].]. uvvuauuuavv vv 1.1.1.1 uvvuullo 1\‘rU’!'. L .0 LILJLL .l\UU I .L.l.. l.\I.llJU1U

stone masonry walls shall not be used in Seismic Design Categories D0,

D1 and D2.

Y1___,,:l1,,, _EA‘,, 1 ,',14 I‘ I I 11 I ('11 I‘ 1- .1 . 1 1

Regardless or the neignt or unbalanced oacxnu rererenceo in me tables,

every masonry foundation shall have a minimum of one #4 reinforcing bar

a maximum of every 4’ on center that is securely anchored in the

supporting footing under the wall. The block cells that contain the

reinforcing steel and the anchor bolts shall be filledwith concrete. If the

tables require more than this minimum, then the requirements ofthe tables

shall apply."

Section R802.lO.5 Truss to wall connection is amended to read as follows.

“R802.lO.5 Truss to wall connection. In addition to the requirements of

4-LI». A...-.4.}.-... ............ 4....-- ..‘L..1‘l L- .....___..._L...l L... -....l‘I ..l..J..... 1.-. 4.1.-
-...... -1.‘

U115 b'UUl.1UIl., CVUI'y LIUSS b'Il'(1l.l DC UUILIIUUISU LU wau PIZHCS Dy LIIC USC 01

approved connectors having a resistance to uplift of not less than 175

pounds (779 N) and shall be installed in accordance with the

manufacturer’s specifications. For roof assemblies subject to wind uplifi

pressures of 20 pounds per square foot (960 Pa) or greater, as established
in Table R301.2(2), adjusted for height and exposure per Table R301 .2(3),

see section R802.1 l.”



Council Bill No. 2010-024 (Continued)

Section R802.11 Roof tie-down. is amended to read as follows:

“R802.1 1.1 Uplift resistance. In addition to the requirements of this

section, eveg rafter shall be connected to the supporting wall assembly by

approved connectors. Roof assemblies which are subject to wind uplift

pressures of 20 pounds per square foot (960 Pa) or greater shall have roof

rafinra nr 1'1-1-mane affnnianri fn H-‘Air annnnrfinnum“ ac-annalnfinc 1-ur
Lulbvlfl U1 uuoovo ubuavnxvu LU unvu ouyyux £1115 vvuu uaavxnxuxxva U]

connections capable ofproviding the resistance required in Table

R802.11. Wind uplift pressures shall be determined using an effective

wind area of 100 square feet (9.3 m2) and Zone 1 in Table R301 .2(2), as

adjusted for height and exposure per Table R301 .2(3).”

Section E330l.l is amended by adding the following paragraph to the

existing section:

“Chapters 33 through 42 of the International Residential Code shall be

amended to include any applicable sections of the 2008 National Electrical

Cnde as ndnnterl and amended hv gentinn 7,6-74 nf the Jrmlin Cnde nf
vvwv wu uuiovrvvho an.» vuunnwnnvnwin uJ uvv-gun. nurv : a V4 vnnv uvrgu. wvuv \IA.

Ordinances."

Section E3 306.l0.1, Exception is amended to read:

"Splices shall be permitted within surface-mounted raceways that have

removable covers, subject to fill requirements."

Qenfinn I-7'1 <04 cl-mil he amended hv adriino the Fnllnurina nm-aoranh at the
...;-n.u..\.:4; ;_4.z.au.a nan... uu |.A|AA\rAA\‘\I\n ul us\a-\.nLLLb “Av ;u.;u VIAAAb range; a; up any

beginning:

"Only copper wire of the correct size and type shall be permitted as

....._--,..... -..A._..“ . A .
,.__..1....A.-..,.. ......I -11 --_.,2l_-,_LA_... -__2LL.'_. ¢L- ._A._.,.A_-__,.. ..L,.‘l1

SUl’VlUC'CI.l.Ll"¢1.IlUU CUIIUUULUIS, H.I.lU an UUIIULIULUIS W1|.Il.1Il LIIC SLILIULLLIVC SIR111

also be copper of the correct size and type. Aluminum or copper-clad
aluminum shall not be permitted as service-entrance conductors, or

conductors within the structure under any circumstance. The wire type and

size used to supply the necessary service up to the point of attachment to

the structure shall be the sole responsibility of Empire District Electric

Company or the Electric Utility Company of the time supplying the City

or Joplln."

Section E3508 shall be amended by adding the following paragraph at the

beginning:



Council Bill No. 2010-024 (Continued)

"The primary grounding electrode for all new construction shall be a

concrete—encased electrode as definedby section E3 508. 1 .2."

PASSED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF JOPLIN, MISSOURI, this 7”’ day of

November, 2011.

Michael R: Woolston, Mayor

ATTEST:

BA./1...- % A/..m/).’..\
(,4! M Mpg

LgfiggggngBarbara L. Hogelin, City lerk
‘

APPROVED AS TO FORI\;I;,_)

��Cj��9jA�fU������Cj��9jG�dU
/_y

��Cj��9js��U a
£760.!vrz/1'7

___’
-,

—

= rian W. Hea
, 1ty Attorney

EFFECTIVE 20 DAYS FROM DATE


