
THEREUPON Alderman Campbell made a motion that if the high bidders do not

respond within 5 working days after notification the Board will accept the second

highest bid. Alderman Boutwell seconded the motion.

Those present and voting "AYE": N. E. Boutwell

N. H. Campbell
Leroy Scott

Michael Lewis

Those present and voting ”NAY”: None

THEREUPON Alderman Lewis made a motion to adjourn. Alderman Scott seconded

the motion.

Those present and voting "AYE": N. E. Boutwell

N. H. Campbell
Leroy Scott

Michael Lewis

Those present and voting ”NAY”: None

There being no further business, the regular meeting of the Mayor and Board

of Aldermen was adjourned on this the 17th day of February, A.D., 1987.

:2gcJa-. ‘b £;v&LA
SIDNEY 0.ZsM1TH, MAYOR
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CITY CLERK
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BE IT REMEMBERED that there was begun and held the regular meeting of the

Mayor and Board of Alderman of the City of Petal, Mississippi, at 7:30 P.M.,

on March 3, 1987 in the Board Room of said City.

Those present: Mayor Sidney 0. Smith

City Attorney: Thomas Tyner

Aldermen: N. E. Boutwell

W. H. Campbell
Leroy Scott

Michael Lewis

R. L. Hullum

Others present: Denise Whitfield

The Mayor declared a quorem present and declared the City Council in

session.

The invocation was offered by Leroy Scott.

The minutes of the regular meeting o§ February 17, 1987 were read by

Priscilla C. Daniel.

THEREUPON Alderman Campbell made a motion that the foregoing minutes be

accepted as read. Alderman Boutwell seconded the motion.

Those present and voting "AYE": N. E. Boutwell

N. H. Campbell
Leroy Scott

Michael Lewis

R. L. Hullum

Those present and voting ”NAY”: None

THEREUPON Denise Whitfield of the Petal Journal addressed the Board about

the City sponsoring an ad supporting the Petal High School Baseball team at

2 rnc+ n'F $19‘? flfl nor run,

42%



L40
T

THEREUPON Mayor Smith advised Ms. Whitfield that the Board would take this

under advisement at this time.

WHEREAS the hour of 7:30 P.M. having arrived, the Mayor and Board of Ald-

ermen proceeded to publicly open and read the sealed bids for the City's annual

gasoline and diesel supply.

The bid reads as follows, to-wit:

I’/‘m’ 145/! 01/ 627.. .7111:
R0. 60X 668

303 EAST 6TH STREET

HATTIESBURG, MISSISSIPN 39401

PHONE 582-3391

February 26, l987

City of Petal

Box 5634

Petal, MS 39465

we will deliver no—lead gasoline from April 1, 1987

through March 3], 1988, in 2000 gallon quantities to

the City of Petal, for 3.7305 per gallon less $.0930
federal tax equaling $.6375 per gallon. We will deliver
diesel in 400 gallon quantities to you for $.5260 plus
applicable tax.

The following oils are included in this bid:

Union Super 10/40 MO 55 gal $3.40 gal
Texaco Havcline 10/40 MO 55 gal 3.40 gal
Union Guardol 30 MO 55 gal 2.80 gal
Union Guardol 30 MO 24/1 cs 3.45 gal
Union Unax Aw 68 55 gal 2.75 gal

(Hyd Oil)

These prices are subject to change with major oil

company increases or decreases.

Sincerely,

/\

>z.m.u /5?. '~'\

James Barr, President

Pine Belt Oil Co., Inc.

THEREUPON Alderman Boutwell made a motion to accept Unocal's low bid for

the City's annual supply of gasoline and diesel fuel. Alderman Campbell seconded

the motion.

Those present and voting "AYE": W. E. Boutwell

W. H. Campbell
Leroy Scott

R. L. Hullum

Michael Lewis

Those present and voting ”NAY”: None

WHEREAS the hour of 7:30 P.M. having arrived, the Mayor and Board of Aldermen

proceeded to publicly open and read the sealed bids for the 6 month bids for

Water & Sewer Dept. supplies. The bids read as follows, to-wit:,

SEE

BIDS

NEXT

PAGE



SPECIFICATIONS FOR: ERAS

AND

bidder shall bid on

Brass Gate Valves -

Connections —

Stem - 

Body - 

Gate - 

Packing - 

Sizes —

Equal to or b 

DELIVERY: F. O. B.,

PRICES shall be FIRM

beginning '3/1/87
items to be purchased

5 CATE VALVES FOR THE PETAL WATER

SEWER DEPARTMENT

the following:

Full Opening:
Iron Pipe Threads both ends

Brass, non rising, with wheel

Red Brass
_

Brass, seal both sides

Conventional or "0" ring
" thru 2”

etter than Crinnell #3000

Petal, Mississippi

for a period of six months

and ending 9/1/87
as required.

#3——— $ 7.42
1” Brass Gate Valve Fig.

1% Brass Gate Valve Fig. #3 - — $ 10-73

1%" Brass Sate Valve Fig. #3 —
- $ 12-93

2" Brass Gate Valve Fig. #3 T T $ 17-“5

As Manufactured by American Valve Mfg. Co.

‘.»"-./ATEFI ’I:iODUC-TS COM PANY

P. O. BOX 7956

123551 MILL STREET 

;‘~.-‘.- 0 Bl LE, ALABAMA 36807

1305/476-5603

IIFICATIONS TOR: VARIOUS BRASS VALVES AND FITTINGS LUR

WATER SERVICE LINES

Bidder shall bid_on the following items, all Ford brass,

equal or better.

1. Straight meter couplings 3/4” NC38-23-2.5 - T ' ' T ' ' T 2-05

Straight meter couplings l“ flC38—44-2.625
- - - - - - - - 3-12

Straight meter couplings w/ Pack Joints 3/4” NC-34~23 - — — “.46

Straight meter cormlings w/ Pack Joints 1” NC-34-44 ~ — ~ - 5-91

2. Straight Couplings 3/4” x 3/4“ Pack Joint both ends

ma-33 — — — — — — — — — — — — - — — — — — — — - — 3.66

SLra1ght couplings 1” x 1“ Pack Joint both ends

ac44-44 — — — — — — - - — — — — — — — - — - — — ~ — 4.214

Straight couplings 3/4” X 3/4“ Adapters Coupling
NC84-33 — — - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 3-09

Straight couplings 3/4" x 3/4" Adapter Coupling
.:c14-33 — — — — — — — — — - _ . — — — — — _ — — — — 3.09

3. Corp. Stops 3/4 CC X Pack Joint HFIUOO - — - - — — — — — 6.20

Corp. Stops 3/4 Pipe x Pack Joint h‘Fl100 — - - - - " - ‘ 7-37

4. Curb Stops 3/4 x 3/4 Pipe X Pipe fiBll233 W ' T - - - - - 7-03

Curb Stops 3/4 x 3/4 Pipe X Pipe fiBLll233 W T ' ' - - - ~ 7-86

Curb Stops 1” x 1” Pipe X Pipe “B11344 — — —
— — - — — - 13.09

Curb STops 3/4 X 3/4 Pack Joint X ITiPipe flB4l233 W — - ~ 8.78

Olrb Stops 3/4 Pack Joint x Meter Nut IIB43232 w — — — - - 8.31»

Curb Stops 3/4 Pack Joint X Meter Nut Angle #KVT-23 W - - - NO BID

Curb Stops 2" Pipe X Pipe 4B1l-777 6
- - - - — » - - - — h8.17

DELIVERY: F. 0. B., Petal, Mississippi

PRICES shall be FIRM for a period of Six hbnths beginning
3/1/87 and ending

purchased as required.

9/1/87 items to be

WATER PRODUCTS COMPANY

P. 0. BOX 7956

2951 MILL STREE"

MO ILE, ALABAMA 38807

7205/476-5\'50£3

SPECIFICATIONS FOR: TURBIN TYPE WATER METERS FOR THE FETAL

WATER 8 SEWER DEPARTMENT

Bidder shall bid on the following:

Turhin jype Water Mgggggz

Material — Main case and measuring chamber, bronze

Flow tube, polyvinylchloride
Roter, thermoplastic
Radial bearings, graphite
Trim, stainless steel

Magnets, ceramic

Meter Registers — Hermetically sealed, direct

straight reading U. S. Gallons

End Connections - Flanged, furnished with flanged

couplings, adapters and/or companion flanges,

(bid both ways).

Maximum Operation Pressure - 150 P.S.I.

Operating Mechanism to be right angle magnetic

drive, no gear drive accepted
Sizes to bid on are: 2", 6”, 8”, 10”

DELIVERY: F. 0. 8., Petal, Mississippi

PRICES shall be FIRM for a period of six (6) months

bezinning 3/1/87 .0 . 
and ending 9/1/87 fiems to

be purchased as required.

2“ Neptune Trident - - — — — $ 300.00

6“ Neptune Trident — — - - - $1,533.00

8” Neptune Trident — — - — — $2,500.00

10" Neptune Trident — — — — N0 BID

WATER PRODUCTS COMPANY

P. o. BOX 7956 

2951 MILL STREET 

:-.r.osn_E, AL/-\E3A.“-fA 36807

205/476-5605

SPECIFICATIONS FOR: POLMBUTYLENE 0

WATER SERVICE TUBING FOR THE FETAL

WATER 6 SEWER DEPARTMENT

Bidder shall bid on the following

1. Polybutylene Water Service tubing (No other material

accepted).
Sizes - 3/4" and 1", copper service size.

Furnished ~ 300 ft} 8 500 ft. rolls (Price per roll).

2500 PSI Test

2- Plastic tubing inserts for polybutylene

tUb1"8 3/4' and l” per 100 for 250d PSI pipe.

DELIVERY: F.0.B., Petal, Mississippi

PRICES shall be FIRM for a period of six (6) months

b€S““‘1"8 3/1/87 and ending 9/1/87 items to

be purchased as required.

300 FT.Roll 500 FT. Roll

(1) 3/4” Orangeburg Blue Max 82.00 132.00

1" Orangeburg Blue Max 119.00 198,00

(2) 3/1+" Plastic Insert — — — $ 25.00 per Hundred

1" Plastic Insert ~ — — — $ 34.00 per Hundred

WATER PRODUCTS comrws‘
P. o. BOX 7956

2951 MILL STREET

MOBILE, ALABAMA 36807

"05/478-5506
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SPECIFXCATIONS FOR: CAST IRON, MECHANICAL JOINT, GATE

VALVES F0“ T” “TY 0*‘ ”“‘L4 ””“55“’‘’‘ s.::::.=:-:ATIONs FOR: VALVE BOXES AND VALVE BOX RIsERs FOR THE

CITY OF PETAL, MISSISSIPPI

Bidder shall bid on the following Gate Valves:

(1) iooer shall bid on the following:

Valve construction features must include:
4 Inch snaft valve box - extension 18 to 24 inches

in

1. Cast iron valve body

2. Cast iron double disk with bronze sealing rings 5: inzh shaft valve box - extension 24 to 36 inches

3. Bronze operating stem

4. Non—ri5ing stem type with 2" square operating nut Ail zaxes to be cast iron two-piece, screw type with lids.

1ns:a11ed
-‘:s to be marked “HATER”.

5. “O” ring seals on stem with one "0" ring above trust

collar, (Dirt Seal), and one "O"ring thrust co11ar,
47:. ;i:3 l"CE valve box risers without lids to fit above in sizes

(water pressure seal)
'4‘ ' 2” ' 2; ' 3" & 4” rises’

6. Double disks equipped with a four point contact vedginz

mechanism
'

TYPES

A. Standard Gate Valves: Sizes 6” through 10" t:
fit SRICZS SHALL BE FIRM FOR A PERIOD OF SIX (6) MONTHS

cast iron pipe. Must be equal to or better t an SEEXNNING 3/1/87 AND ENDING 9/1/87 TTEMS To BE

“"11” “‘238°'2° 3.15.-IASEDAS REQUIRED

B. Cut-in Gate Valves: 6“ through 10” must be equal to

or better than Huellar 0H-802

Valve Box - — r
— — $ 16.88

Valve Box — — — - - $ 24.38

All valves furnished with accessories.

All valves must :oniorm to AHHA Standard UC-S00-71 1” T:lVé ELX 3iS8F — ' - — ' $ 7-20

ii” Valve Box Riser - - - _ - $ 9.20

Bidder shall state in bid prices in stock _ 

H‘
- - - - - $ 9.33

DELIVERY: F. 0. 3., Fetal, Hississippi 3"
- - - - — $ 12.67

~

' ' ' - ' $ 15-33

PRICES shall be FIRM for a period of (Q sixnnnflu beghm-

In; 3/1/87 and ending 9/1/87» items to be

purchased as required.
WATER PRODUCTS COMPANY

(A) $~ Clow 

F—50:5 M3 gate 1’/aive
- ‘ ' 

: ���k���k����
P. 0. BOX 7956

””
”1 F- O M ate a ve — - - 4 . ,,—-

T: CIOW F‘ E06: MJ Gate Valve 33 1+2} 49
T351 MILL STREET

_

”

ow —

‘ ' ' - I‘

���k���k���� BILE, ALABAMA 35507
“.f-..7'/.''v‘_.':

«*

(B) NO BID

.;.I:~/o -x8u-'5

WATER PRODUCTS COMPANY

P. 0. BOX 7956 

2S"l MILL STREET

MOBILE, Al-/iii-ZAT’-z*..5\ 3'-3307

2U5%7G$7 U

H

SPECIFICATXONS FOR:MECHANICAL JOINT RETAINER GLANDS FOR THE
39551F13*T10N5 FOR: MALLEABLE IRON TAPPING SADDLES FOR THE 

PETAL HATER & SENER DEPARTMENT
FETAL WATER & SEHER DEPARTMENT

BIDDER SHALL BID ON THE EOLLONING:
awo” 5”“ “U 0“ “*5 FOLLOWING:

MECHANICAL JOINT RETAINER GLANDs FOR CAST IRON, PvC & C900 PIPE
‘”*‘‘''‘“°‘9 “W TdPPl'n9 Saddles:

SIZES: 6", 8", 10"

MATERIAL - Ductile iron only
furnished with threaded lugs or grooved

0 fit: 2",6"a".1o"1n cast iron. Pvc & AC Pipe
.Ilets: i/4 I.P.T on 2"! 6“, 8“ and 10" all types of pipe

isted above. Single strap

2” I'P'T° °” 5l195 5". 8“ and 10“ cast iron

DELIVERY: F.0.B. Petal, MS doUb]e strap.

.:.IVER¥: F.0.B. Petal, Mississippi

PRlCEs SHALL BE FIRM FOR A PERIOD OF SIX (6) MONTHS BEGINNING
“Z555 ‘HALL 55 “R” FOR A PERIOD fl‘ SIX ((15 MONTHS BEGINNING

IT 

7
"

)

3/1/87 AND ENDING 9/1/87 EMS SHALL BE PURCHASED
;S Rrégiégg

AND ENDING 9/1/87 TEMs TO BE PURCHASED

As REQUIRED.

" '

6" Ebaa Series 1200 Retainer Gland For C.I. - - — $ 9.61;
2 X 

���k���k����
JCM “'03 ‘ ‘ ' - - - $ 6.21

.
.

2 t ; ~ CM
“ ‘

— — . . - -

8” Ebaa Series 1200 Retalner Gland For C.I. - — - $ 1h.94 C 
a I

J *0) $ 11-00

10" Ebaa Series 1200 Retainer Gland For C.I. — — $ 22.28 ,'
1 1/“ “TM W3 ' ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘ ° $ 12-75

..
X 3/» JCM Q03 - - - — — - $ 15_6Q

6“ Ebaa Series 500 & 5500 for PVC & C-900 - - — $ 22.36
,

—

Vfil I‘

_ _ _ _ _ - _

���k���k���� Ebaa Series 500 & 5500 for PVC & C-900 — — - $ 33.03 j
X ‘ W" *0‘ 35 19 7“

2
.

J v o

E

. . . . . _ _

10" Ebaa Series 500 & 5500 for PVC 35 C-900 — - - $ 62.50 A’ 2R c_ 0‘ $ 22-13

~ Y : J.5 ~02 - — - — — — _ $ 30 61

'

‘.‘.’.’-‘.TE.'3T PRODUCTS CON‘.

‘ ���k���kq�p� 0. BOX 7956

'.£‘3'3l MILL. STREET

‘A

INOBTLE, AL/‘.3/-\I"v’lA 36"“"‘7

3'78-5608



SPCIFICATIONS FOR: SEWER PIPE AND FITTINGS FOR THE

CITY OF PETAL WATER & SEWER DEPARTMENT

Bidder shall bid on the following: PVC
f

S.D.R. 35 - A.S.T.M.D-3034

pipe 7 fittings with bell joint, gasket in place one end,

other end plain. Fitting: Bid both gasket type and solvent weld.

Pipe Sizes - 4". 6". 8". 10" in 13'‘ lengths

Fittings sizes - 4“, 6", 8“, 10“ - wys - I/8-I/l6-I/4 bends

Clean out plugs for 4“ & 6“ solvent weld complete

Delivery F.O.B. Petal, Ms

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR A PERIOD OF SIX (6) MONTHS BEGINNING

gm

6”

an

10”

E

t“

(1)

(7:

On

an

3/1/87 AND ENDING 9/1/87 ITEMS TO BE PURCHASED

AS REQUIRED

3034 SDR-35 — — - $ .59

303A SDR—35 — - — $ 1.26

303D sDR—35 — — - $ 1.97

3034 sDH~35 - - - $ 3.02

wyr D50 22§° _900

— - 3.N2 2.0a 2.0? 2.64

- — 8.45 3.88 '4.39 4.9U

- — 2N.82 1u.9N 1N.78 1N.38

— 5h.NO 28.7N 29.u2 No.09

Solvent Weld Clean out Plug — — $ 3.26

Solvent Weld Clean out Plug — - $ 12.496"

‘-.i"t"ATE'r'i‘ PRODUCTS COMPANY

3. 0. BOX 7956

3.351 MILL STREET

JOBILE, ALABAIVIA 38507

‘Dill

(/) VY19 CIFICATIONS FOR:

n zen./3!O'uOLH3
<\

LEAK REPAIR CLAMPS, COLLAR LEAK CLAMPS,
AND COMPRESSION FITTINGS FOR THE PETAL

WATER AND SEWER DEPARTMENT

BIDDER SHALL BID ON THE FOLLOWING:

l. 

DELI

All Purpose Leak Repair Clamps:
Material: Band - Stainless Steel

Lugs - Gray Iron, or malleable iron, ductile

iron or stainless steel
Gaskets - Rubber compound with grid surface

Bolts and Nuts — Galvanized or electroplated

‘ V

steel or stainless steel.

Sizes to fit: 3/4“ and 2” steel pipe.
Nidths: 6“

Compression Fittings for Steel Hater Pipe
Material: Metal must be galvanized, electrocated or corrosive

resistent.

Sizes to fit: 3/4" and 2“ diameter steel pipe
lengths: 5” sleeves

VERY: F. O. B. Petal, Mississippi

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR A PERIOD OF (6) SIX MONTHS BEGINNING
March 1. 1987 AND ENDING September 1. 1987ITEMs TO BE PURCHASED

AS REQUIRED

(1) 3/4 Leak Repair Clamp - Cascade Mfg. - — — $ 3.48

2" Leak Repair Clamp — Cascade Mfg. - — — $ 5 O8

(2) 3/4” Galvanized Compression Coupling - Dresser - — - $ 5.18

2” Galvanized Compression Coupling — Dresser - — - $10.8A

W.’-‘«.TEI*~T PFTODUCTS COMPANY

3. O. BOX 7956

2951 MILL STREET 

MOBILE, ALABAMA 36607

SPEC POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (P.V.C) WATER PIPE,

PVC FITTINGS & PVC CEMENT FOR THE PETAL

HATER & SEWER DEPARTMENT

IFICATIONS FOR:

Bidder shall bid On the following:

KA}

PVC water pipe, I.P.S.

One end bell type solvent weld joint, other end

plain end solvent weld.

Size - 3/4 - 1“ and 2” diamenter I.D.

length - 20 ft lengths
Schedule 40, and 200 P.S.I. pipe

PVC Water pipe I.P.S.

One bell end gasket type, other plain end

size 2”, 6” 8“ and 10”

Schedule 160 P.S.I. pipe

PVC water pipe fittings
Tees ~ 3/4“ 1“ & 2"

Ells — 3/4“ I" & 2”

Couplings - 3/4“ -1“ & 2“

Caps - 3/4“ 1“ & 2“

Bushings, various sizes 3/4“ — 1“ & 2“

Schedule 40

Quote prices on fittings

4. PVC Cement and cleaner

I pint - 1 pint — 1qt’Containers with brush in can

attched to lid.

5. PVC water pipe I.P.S.

one bell end gasket type, other plain end

size 6“, 8" and 10”

Class 150 C 900

’RICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR A PERIOD OF SIX (6) MONTHS BEGINNING

3/1/87 ‘\ND ENDING 9/1/87 ITEMS TO BE PURCHASED

AS REQUIRED

:1) « H0 BID

I2) 2 PVC Water Pipe IFS - — — $ .26

6” PVC Water Pipe IPS — — — $ 1.75

8” PVC Water Pipe IFS ~ - - $ 3.00

10” PVC Water Pipe IPS — — — $ 4.60

ABOVE PIPE CL—160

(3) — NO BID

(U) - NO BID

(5) 6" CL—15O C-900 PVC — - — $ 2.75

8" CL—15O C-900 PVC — — — $ 4.70

10" CL-150 C-900 PVC - - — $ 6.68

W "TTER PRODUCTS COMPANY

rm~
.

-ti
... .4

P. ”. BOX 7956

51 MILL STREET

;"'~.'lCl'3.-I LE, ALABAMA 38807
Ff‘

En 
I.-V

- --

‘C-.’47C>-‘JCGIS


























